CITY OF HOMER

PUBLIC WORKS TELEPHONE (807)235-3170
3575 HEATH STREET  HOMER, AK 99603 FACSIMILE (907)235-3145

MEMORANDUM (4- (11

To: Walt Wrede, City Manager
From: Jan C Jonker, Acting Public Works Director _-
Date: 17 August 2009
Subject: WATER TREATMENT PLANT PAVING
Construction Contract Award Recommendations
Project No. 215.865.5261
IEa—————-__ = " ———— —-—+"°"° - —————"-—""
Discussion:

Public Works has requested and received two quotes from area paving contractors to provide materials and labor
to complete the paving portion of the new Water Treatment Plant Project. The results of the quotes received are;

¢ Peninsula Asphalt Paving, Inc. $69,750.00
e Clark Management (Tom Clark) $61,805.00

This project includes the materials and all labor associated with completing the work and includes shaping the
existing grade and providing 2” each of base coarse and asphalt material.

Clark Management submitted an email quote providing only the quoted amount and is an unfamiliar contractor
and new to the paving business. Additional information was requested from Clark Management on |3 August

and again on 18 August with no response. Clark Management was called on 19 August and indicated that due to
present work load desires to withdraw his proposal.

Award Recommendation:

Award this contract to in the amount of $69,750.00 to Peninsula Asphalt Paving, Inc., P.O. Box 8407, Nikiski,
AK 99635-8407 and authorize the City Manager to execute all required contract documents.

Fiscal Note:

This work is budgeted in the Water Treatment Plant Project, account no. 215.865.

¢. project file
attachments (bids info)



Jun 26 09 10:48Sa De Lars 907-776-5491 p.1

James Decker P.O. Box 8407 Nikiski,AK 99635-8407

President Phone: 776-8646 Cell: 398-4646 Fux: 776-5491

City of Hiomer Homer Water Treatment Plant

Carcy Mcyer

Jan Jonker

Fux 235-3145

DATE; DATEOF PLANS: | START WORK DATK: | YOUR INQUIRY NO.. PROPOSAL NO.: PAGENQ: | OF PAGES
06/25/09 | 1

Work to be performed include: grading, shaping and compacting existing grade. 1)-1 crushed

Aggregate 10 be added as a leveling course and compacted. Two inches of asphalt concrete o be paved on

Approximatcly 23,250 square [eet of area and compacted.  $69,750.00

-n—

Proposal Includes:  Material and (abor s required in accordunce with the above specifications for the sum of;
Dollars
SIXTY NINE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FIFTY & NQ/100 $69,750.00

TO BL PAID AS FOLLOWS: completion of project

Al muterial is guaranteed to be as specilied.  All work to be completed In a workmanlike manner according to standard
practices.  Any alteration or deviation from above specifications involying extra costs will be exccuted only upon written
orders, and will become an extra charge over and above the estimate. - All agrecments contingent upon strikes, accidents or
dolays beyond our control.  Qwner o carry fire, tomudo and other necessary insurance.  Our workers arc fully covered by
Workmen's Compensation Insurunce,

NOTE: THIS PROPOSAL MAY BE WITHDRAWN BY US IF NOT ACCLEPTED WITHIN DAYS,

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE DATE"

ACCEPTANCL OF PROPOSAL:

The above prices, specifications and conditions are satisfactory and are hereby accepled.  You arc authorized to complete
this comract as specificd.  Paymcent will be made as outlined ubove.

AUTHORIZED SIGNATUR(: ' DATE

COMPANY
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From: Tom Clark [akclarkmgmt@yahoo.com]
Sent: Monday, June 22, 2009 10:38 AM

To: Carey Meyer

Subject: Jlonker@ci.homer.ak.us

Carey, Thanks for the opportunity to quote your Water Plant paving project.

The total bid based on 23,500 square feet of paved area with prep is $61,805.00 or 2.63 sq ft.
Please feel free to call with questions..

Tom Clark

Clark Management

PO Box 962

Anchor Point AK 99556
907-299-2422
akclarkmgmt/@yahoo.com

I of | 872009 2:25 PM



Jan Jonker

To: Tom Clark
Cc: Walt Wrede; Carey Meyer; Jim Hobbs
Subject: FW: Paving Proposal - 2nd request for info

18 August 2009
Mr. Clark,
On 13 August, | sent you an email requesting additional information about your asphalt paving company.

This is the second and final request for additional information concerning your Asphalt Paving Company in regards to
your email quote to provide asphalt paving services for the new Water Treatment Plant. We must make an award
decision far this work no later than tomorrow , 19 August 2009, at 10:00 a.m. If this information submitted is
insufficient or incomplete your proposal may be excluded.

If you are still interested in performing this work we must have the information requested by that time. If you are no
longer interested in this project, please inform us

1 will try to call you today.

Thank you

WS 3¢ )%

From: Jan Jonker

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2009 7:41 AM
To: Tom Clark'

Cc: Walt Wrede; Carey Meyer; Jim Hobbs
Subject: Paving Proposal

13 August 2009
Mr. Clark,

We are reviewing the paving proposals submitted for the new Water Treatment Plant and require some
additional information from you. Would you please provide us with the following.

1. Like projects completed with a reference name and contact phone number.

2. Listing of your paving and associated equipment. Include make, model and year.

3. Personnel positions and associated experience. |.E. Paving Foreman, lay-down machine operator, roller
operator(s) etc.

4. Insurance and bonding information.

5. Asphalt source.

Upon receiving this information we will complete our review of all proposals submitted.

Thank You,



Mr Jan C Jonker

Citv of Homer, Alavka
Public Works Superintencent
3373 Heath St

Homer, Ak 09603

Pl 967-233-3170

Honker a oL homer. ak ns




