Sand Sand 9/15-2" Minus 2" Minus
BIDDER'S NAME 8/15-9/15 4/30 by 8/7 8/7-4/30 D-1by8/7
RC Land
Improvements S 1266 $ 1850 $ 1366 $ 1950 nobid
Brown
ConstructionCo. S 1800 $ 1800 $ 1900 $ 19.00 $§ 20.30
Dirtt Co LLC $ 16.50 S 2050 § 1700 S 21.00 S 19,50
Gregoire
Construction Non Responsive Not on plan holder's list
A&D Services $ 1875 $ 2250 S$ 1875 $§ 2250 $ 26.25
Dibble Creek Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Twin Peaks no bid no bid $ 2230 $§ 2230 $ 2890

D1
8/7-4/30

no bid

$ 20.30
S 23.50
S 30.25

no bid
S 28.90

Airport
Maint.
Sand by
8/7

no bid

S 19.00
S 20.50
$ 18.75

$ 18.23
no bid

Airport

Maint, Type I Typelll
Sand 8/7- Gravel by Gravel 8/7-
4/30 8/7 4/30

no bid S 1066 S§ 16.66
S 1%.00 § 15.00 $ 15.00
$ 2550 § 1350 § 17.50
§ 2250 $ 1600 $ 20.00
S 25.00 no bid no bid
no bid S 1680 S 16.80



