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Office of the City Clerk

491 East Pioneer Avenue
City of Homer Homer, Alaska 99603
www.cityofhomer-ak.gov clerk@cityofhomer-ak.gov

(p) 907-235-3130
(f) 907-235-3143

TO: Frank Griswold, Appellant
FROM: Melissa Jacobsen, CMC, Deputy City Clerk
DATE: December 30,2014

SUBJECT: Notice of Appeal Record Complete and Hearing

Appeal: Of Walt Wrede’s Denial of Frank Griswold’s November 6 and November 11, 2014
Public Records Requests

The appeal record is complete for Frank Griswold’s appeal to the City Council. The hearing
has been scheduled for Monday, January 5, 2015 at 5:30 p.m. The meeting will be held at
City Hall Cowles Council Chambers, 491 E. Pioneer Avenue, Homer, Alaska.

Attached is appeal record for both appeals.

cc. Interim City Manager Yoder
City Attorney Klinkner






Melissa Jacobsen

From: Frank Griswold <fsgriz@alaska.net>

Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 10:59 PM

To: Jo Johnson

Cc: Melissa Jacobsen

Subject: Fwd: Appeal of Partial Denial of 11/6/14 Public Records Request

Begin forwarded message:

From: Frank Griswold <fsgriz@alaska.net>

Date: December 10, 2014 10:57:24 PM AKST

To: Jo Johnson <Jjohnson @ci.homer.ak.us>

Subject: Fwd: Appeal of Partial Denial of 11/6/14 Public Records Request

Ms. Johnson:

On December 3, 2014, I identified independent grounds for appealing Mr. Wrede's partial denial of my
November 6, 2014 public records request? Do you intend to schedule an appeal hearing regarding this
matter? If not, why not?

Frank Griswold

Begin forwarded message:

From: Frank Griswold <fsgriz@alaska.net>

Date: December 3, 2014 5:53:12 AM AKST

To: Jo Johnson <JJohnson@ci.homer.ak.us>

Subject: Re: Appeal of Partial Denial of 11/6/14 Public Records Request

Ms. Johnson:

City Manager Walt Wrede's partial denial of my November 6, 2014 public records request states: "Records in
the Clerk's Office identify Holly Wells as the person who assisted the BOA in writing its June 6, 2014 Decision
on Appeal. Communications between Ms. Wells and the Board regarding it's Decision are privileged attorney
client communications and subject to the deliberative process privilige [sic]." Regulation 5.01 requires a
written response that includes a description of the records that will not be provided. Mr. Wrede failed to
adequately describe the communications between Ms. Wells and the Board that he deemed subject to attorney
client privilege and deliberative process privilege. I believe there are undisclosed communications
between/among city officials and/or city employees regarding Ms. Well's "assistance" in writing the Board's
Decision i.e., records not originating from Ms. Wells. Furthermore, since Ms.Wells was allegedly representing
the Board as a neutral advisor on procedural matters only, the attorney client privilege and deliberative process

1
4



privilege do not apply. These are independent grounds for appealing Mr. Wrede's denial of my public records
request so please re-open this matter and schedule an appeal hearing.

Frank Griswold
On Dec 2, 2014, at 10:59 AM, Jo Johnson wrote:

Mr. Griswold,

By an email message dated November 20, 2014, you gave notice of appeal from the City
Manager's partial denial of your November 6, 2014 public records request. Your notice stated
that the subject of your appeal was the redaction of 8 sections of various invoices for legal
services provided to the City. The City now has provided you with copies of the same invoices
without redaction. Thus this ground for your appeal is moot. The remaining statements in your
notice are not independent grounds for appealing a denial of a public records request. Therefore,
the City considers this matter to be concluded, and an appeal hearing will not be scheduled.

Jo Johnson

From: Frank Griswold [maﬂto:fsgriz@alaska.net]

Sent: Thursday, November 20, 2014 4:58 PM

To: Jo Johnson

Cc: Walt Wrede

Subject: Appeal of Partial Denial of 11/6/14 Public Records Request

Pursuant to HCC 1.18.070 and City of Homer Regulation 5.04, I hereby appeal City Manager
Walt Wrede's partial denial of my November 6, 2014 Public Records Request. Mr. Wrede
redacted 8 sections of various invoices for legal services provided to the city in regards to my
BOA appeal of CUP 13-13 without identifying the reason(s) for the nondisclosures, including
reference to provisions of law or regulations. This constitutes a violation of Regulation 5.

01. Furthermore, some of the redacted portions were previously disclosed and therefore are
irrebuttably not entitled to confidentially. Mr. Wrede is attempting to obstruct justice by
concealing the fact that Attorney Thomas Klinkner influenced the Board of Adjustment's
Decision regarding CUP 13-13 by communicating with Attorney Holly Wells through an
intermediary, Attorney Mitchi McNabb (an associate attorney with the law firm of Birch Horton
Bittner & Cherot). The fact that Mr. Klinkner's communications were surreptitiously
transmitted to Ms. Wells clearly proves that there was no "Chinese Wall" or other ethical screen
to prevent such communications as alleged at the April 9, 2014 appeal hearing by Ms.

Wells. Mr. Wrede, Ms. McNabb, Mr. Klinkner, Ms. Wells and others have conspired to deceive
me and thwart my appeal.



Frank Griswold -
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fWalt Wrede

. I
“rom: Walt Wrede
ent: Tuesday, November 11, 2014 8:42 AM
To: 'Frank Griswold'
Subject: RE: November 6, 2014 Public Records Request
Mr. Griswold:

1. No. There are no communications between Ms. Wells and the Board. There are communications between Ms. Wells
and the Clerk's office and the Mayor regarding the drafting of the decision. After the Board made its decision, it passed
that decision, along with its reasons and findings, to Ms. Wells and requested that she draft the final Decisional
document. The communications were related to clarification of the Board's intent and making sure the decisional
document accurately reflected the Board's decision.

2. Yes. There are invoices from May and July which confirm that Holly Wells wrote the decisional document. Redacted
copies of these invoices will be available for you to pick up at the Clerk's office on Wednesday after 10 AM

Walt

From: Frank Griswold [mailto:fsgriz@alaska.net]
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 1:18 PM

To: Walt Wrede
" ubject: November 6, 2014 Public Records Request

Mr. Wrede:

Do all of records in the Clerk's Office that identify Holly Wells as the person who assisted the Board of Adjustment in
writing its June 6, 2014 Decision constitute communications between Ms. Wells and the Board? Have any invoices been
received by the city for the services provided by Ms. Wells with respect to writing that Decision? If so, please provide
them to me. Invoices for attorney services are not entitled to attorney-client privilege or otherwise exempt from
disclosure.

Frank

is
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(b0r) 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homexr July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184905

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 23.62
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

CURRENT CHARGES $23.62

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkk*kk*x PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *****kx*x*

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO gﬁ@“ﬁgﬁ%ﬁgﬁ?ﬁ’ ENUE

Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15552 él;;}(z)ﬂ. N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oz 535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184905
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0566
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

06/02/14 M McNabb 1.50 Conference with H. Wells regarding drafting
Board of Adjustment decision; review and
analyze City Code regarding definition of ex
parte, appeal rights, necessity of "notice of
appeal? language in decision, definition of
"final decision," and whether decision is final
decision; review final draft of decision; email
H. Wells regarding comments on final draft of
decision

06/02/14 H Wells 2.80 Revise and finalize written decision; email
correspondence with M. Jacobsen and Mayor
regarding same; conduct research regarding
related procedural matters

06/03/14 H Wells 1.10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
written decision; conduct research regarding

finality of decision partially remanded

06/04/14 H Wells 1.90 Revise written decision; telephone conference
with J. Johnson regarding same

06/05/14 H Wells .40 Review Written Decision and telephone
conference with M. Jacobson regarding same
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

o

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
NS ISTHSTREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(207) 595800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
July 9, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

06/06/14 H Wells .60 Revisions to written decision; telephone
conference with J. Johnson regarding same

06/09/14 H Wells .90 Advise Board prior to deliberations regarding
procedure for considering post hearing motions;
review Motion for Reconsideration regarding
procedural points for reconsideration

06/10/14 H Wells 1.20 Meeting with D. Gross regarding procedure for
post hearing motions; conduct research
regarding due process obligations

06/11/14 H Wells 1.90 Draft Order regarding reconsideration based
upon Board direction; meeting with D. Gross
regarding same; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding same

06/16/14 H Wells .40 Email correspondence with P. Crowe/J. Johnson
regarding service of post hearing motions

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research 23.62
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $23.62

Total This Matter $23.62
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LAW OFFICES .
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1STH STREET, NV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 : (907) 276-1550
fpor) 6595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 3

City of Homer July 9, 2014

TOTAL OUTSTANDING INVOICES:
DATE INVOICE # AMOUNT

06/18/14 184814 $617.45
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT
( 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ligllxsnlfoigl N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(Bor) 6553400 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

May 13, 2014

City of Homer
Invoice # 184547

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 202.39
i Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13
CURRENT CHARGES $202.39

e

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

NT  *% %Kk kkx

VENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCEIORAGE, ALASE A Shegs

Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1156 15TH STREET, N.W.
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005
(202) 659-5800

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

May 13, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184547

491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

Matter: 0566

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/04/14 H Wells

04/08/14 H Wells

04/09/14 M McNabb

3.

5.

5.

10 Review briefing and prepare for hearing

80 Review Griswold's reply brief; prepare hearing
transcript; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding conflict of interest matters
for presentation to the Board; draft response
to additional procedural issues

80 Conferences with H. Wells; research and analyze
City code regaxdd d i rd

review emal

from City to Griswold regarding procedural
issues; research and analyze City code
regarding information required on applications
for CUP's; review record on appeal; research
and analyze unauthorized practice of law and
whether party who doeg not file brief can
participate in oral argument; draft responses
cural i i ;
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 "5T§L51'1F_I;EI}25£ N.w. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 (907) 276-1550
faoz) 653800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

GriswoldiAppeal of CUP 13-13
04/09/14 H Wells 8.20 Attend and prepare for hearing; revise and

expand hearing procedural agenda; meetings with
J. Johnson and D. Gross regarding same

04/10/14 D Gross .50 Conference regarding procedural issues related
to hearing

04/11/14 H Wells 1.40 Email correspondence with J. Johmnson and
telephone conference with J. Johmson regarding
Griswold's supplemental brief's; review brief

04/14/14 M McNabb .60

discuss drafting
Board of Adjustment decision

04/14/14 H Wells 4.90

email
correspondence with F. Griswold regarding spot
zoning; conduct research regarding same

04/16/14 H Wells -80 Email correspondence with F. Griswold regarding
supplemental authority; conduct research
regarding process of addressing same

04/17/14 H Wells 2.30 Telephone conference with Mayor regarding
procedural matters surrounding F. Griswold's
supplemental filings; conduct research
regarding same; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding procedural matters; conduct
research regarding same

04/22/14 M McNabb -20 Review notes regarding drafting Board of
Adjustment's decision
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15'1';1[1511;1;1’;‘;’; NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 (907) 276-1550
(bR 6355800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 3

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13
04/23/14 H Wells 3.10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding

supplemental filings; initiate scribing of
Board's final decision ’

04/25/14 H Wells 2.70 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
Board procedural matters; conduct research
regarding same

Disbursements

04/30/14 d 202.39
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS , $202.39

$202.39
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LAW OFFICES (/2014
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT (VW//J@’&M)
1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
124 5TH STREET, W, - ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-155G
(60R 95800  FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 6506742

May 13, 2014

City of Homer
Invoice # 184547

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Bpril 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13~-13 202.39

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

CURRENT CHARGES $202.39

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kxkk¥k4% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***hkkkkk

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO R B EN T AVENUE

Please note, there will be . .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1154 STH STREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1026 .
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6555800 FAX (507) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184547
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, BAK 29603

For Professional Sexrvices Rendered Through April 30, 2014
Matter: 0566
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/04/14 H Wells © 3.10 Review briefing and prepare for hearing

- -

04/08/14 B Wells 5.80 Review Griswold's reply brief; prepare hearing
transcript; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding conflict of interest matters
for presentation te the Board; draft response
to additional procedural issues

04/08/14 M McNabb 5.80 Conferences with H. Wells; research and analyze
City code regarding standing to appeal to Board
of Adjustment; review email from T. Klinkner
regarding standing to appeal; review emails
from City to Griswold regarding procedural
issues; research and analyze City code
regarding information required on applications
for CUP's; review record on appeal; research
and analyze unauthorized practice of law and
whether party who does not file brief can
participate in oral argument; draft responses
to procedural guestions posed by Griswold;

shepardize cases regarding dual representation;
email H. Wells
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

) 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 15"‘? l;’;‘ﬁf; NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 2003 {907) 276-1550
(e éon600 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 _ Page: 2

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/09/14 H Wells 8.20 Attend and prepare for hearing; revise and
expand hearing procedural agenda; meetings with
J. Johnscon and D, Gross regarding same

04/10/14 D Gross .50 Conference regarding procedural issues related-
to hearing .

04/11/14 H Wells 1.40 Email correspondence with J. Johnson and
: telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
Griswold's supplemental brief's; review brief

04/14/14 M McNabb .60 Conference with H. Wells regarding potential
conflict of interest, phone 8. Van Goor and
leave a voicemail message, discuss drafting
Board of Adjustment decision

04/14/14 H Wells 4.90 Telephone conference with §. Van Goor regarding
conflict of interest challenges; meeting with
D. Gross regarding conflicts of interest and
research regarding City's position; email
correspondence with F. Griswold regarding spot
zoning; conduct research regarding same

04/16/14 H Wells .80 Email correspondence with F. Griswold regarding
supplemental authority; conduct research
regarding process of addressing same

04/17/14 H Wells 2,30 Telephone conference with Mayor regarding
procedural matters surrounding F. Griswold's
supplemental filings; conduct research
regarding same; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding procedural matters; conduct
research regarding same

04/22/14 M McNabb .20 Review notes regarding drafting Board of
Adjustment's decision
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LAW OFFICES :
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1200
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 {907} 276-1550
Gy esnss0 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 A Page: 3

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/23/14 H Wells '3.10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
supplemental filings; initiate scribing of
Board's final decision

04/25/14 H Wells 2.70 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding

Board procedural matters; conduct research
regaxrding same

Disbursements - h
04/30/14 Computer Research 202.38
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $202.39
Total This Matter $202.39
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Melissa Jacobsen

From: Frank Griswold <fsgriz@alaska.net>

Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 11:00 PM

To: Jo Johnson

Cc: Melissa Jacobsen

Subject: Fwd: Appeal of Partial Denial of November 11, 2014 Public Records Request

Begin forwarded message:

From: Frank Griswold <fsgriz@alaska.net>

Date: December 10, 2014 10:45:11 PM AKST

To: Jo Johnson <Jjohnson @ci.homer.ak.us>

Subject: Appeal of Partial Denial of November 11, 2014 Public Records Request

Ms. Johnson:

Pursuant to HCC 1.18.070 and City of Homer Regulation 5.04, I hereby appeal City Manager Walt Wrede's
partial denial of my November 11, 2014 Public Records Request. Mr. Wrede's response dated November 26,
2014 states: "All time entries for litigation matters are omitted due to Attorney-Client privilege (HCC
2.84.040)." Regulation 5.01 requires a written response that includes a description of the records that will not
be provided. Mr. Wrede failed to adequately describe the omitted time entries he deemed subject to attorney
client privilege and those time entries are not exempt from disclosure due to attorney-client privilege. Mr.
Wrede redacted one entry of the June 18, 2014 invoice claiming it contained advice on a potential litigation
matter. Attorney invoices only describe the general nature of the services performed by the billing attorney and
the time spent on the tasks described. Mr. Wrede also redacted one entry of the September 17, 2014 invoice
pertaining to services provided by City Attorney Holly Wells on August 12, 2014 regarding the Appeal of CUP
14-05, claiming it concerned "an on-going litigation matter." But all of the other (unredacted) entries on the
September 17, 2014 invoice pertain to the same matter i.e., the Appeal of CUP 14-05. Furthermore, the
redacted entry on the September 17, 2014 invoice pertains to services rendered by City Attorney Holly Wells
who was allegedly acting in a neutral capacity in her representation of the Board of Adjustment regarding the
appeal of CUP 14-05 (from which she subsequently recused herself). Accordingly, even if it did contain legal
advice pertaining to on-going litigation, it would not be exempt from disclosure due to attorney-client
privilege. Invoices for services provided by Joseph Levesque were not disclosed. On December 5, 2014, Mr.
Wrede stated: "Oh yeah. That is right. I believe two invoices were received and processed. We'll get them
ready. The Clerk's will let you know when they are available." To date, these invoices have still not been
disclosed; there is no justification for the denial or redaction of any portion of these invoices.

Billing information and fee agreements are not protected by the attorney-client privilege unless disclosure
would reveal the substance of confidential communication between a lawyer and a client. Chandry v.
Gallerizzo, 174 F.3d 394 (4th Cir. 1999) (bills that reveal identity of statutes researched were privileged);
Mordesovitch v. Westfield Ins. Co., 244 F. Supp. 2d 636 (S.D. W. Va. 2003) (fee information and engagement
letters not protected by attorney-client privilege).
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In Clarke v. American Commerce National Bank, 974 F.2d 127, 130 (9th Cir.1992), the United States Court of
Appeals for the Ninth Circuit found that client billing records were not protected under the attorney-client
privilege. The court discussed the case as follows: “The statements contain information on the identity of the
client, the case name for which payment was made, the amount of the fee, and the general nature of the services
performed. Our previous decisions have held that this type of information is not privileged.” Id. The court
held that “the district court erred in concluding that the attorney-client privilege applies to the attorney billing
statements subpoenaed by the OCC.” Id. The court explained that “[t]he burden of establishing that the
attorney-client privilege applies to the documents in question rests with the party asserting the privilege.”
Id., 129.

The United States Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit similarly held that records relating to law firm's fee
arrangements with, and disbursements on behalf of, their clients were not protected by the attorney-client
privilege. The court explained that “[w]e consistently have held that, absent special circumstances, client
identity and fee information are not privileged. The goal of enabling attorneys to offer informed professional
advice and advocacy cannot be accomplished if courts may compel disclosure of communications between the
client and attorney necessary to the provision of such services . But where the communication is not
confidential and is not necessary to obtain informed legal advice for the client, no privilege exists . While
consultation with an attorney, and payment of a fee, may be necessary to obtain legal advice, their disclosure
does not inhibit the ordinary communication necessary for an attorney to act effectively, justly, and
expeditiously.” (Citations omitted; internal quotation marks omitted.) In re Grand Jury Subpoena Served
Upon Doe, 781 F.2d 238, 247 (2d Cir.) (en banc), cert. denied, 475 U.S. 1108, 106 S.Ct. 1515, 89 L.Ed.2d 914
(1986).

"The view of courts from around the country is that the attorney-client privilege does not authorize an attorney
to refuse to disclose the fact that communications have taken place between a client and an attorney. The case
law on this point is summarized in the following passage from Stephen A. Saltzburg, Michael M. Martin, and
Daniel J. Capra, Federal Rules of Evidence Manual (7th ed. 1998), Vol. 2, pp. 711-12: [T]he [attorney-client]
privilege does not protect the preliminary aspects of the attorney-client relationship itself. These matters, which
have been referred to as the &quot;incidents of representation,&quot; include the client's name, the amount and
payment of a fee, and the fact of consultation. The incidents of representation are not generally considered
privileged because they are independent of the confidential communications necessary for the representation.
The identity of the client, the fee, and the fact and extent of representation are generally incidental to the
formation and maintenance of the relationship, and have nothing to do with the free flow of information once
that relationship has been established. . . . As Judge Winter stated in the leading case of In re Shargel, 742 F.2d
61 (2d Cir. 1984): Absent special circumstances, disclosure of the identity of the client and fee information
stand on a footing different from communi-cations intended by the client to explain a problem to [the] lawyer in
order to obtain legal advice.... A general rule requiring disclosure of the fact of consultation does not place
attorneys in the professional dilemma of cautioning [the client] against disclosure and [thereby] rendering
perhaps ill-informed advice or [on the other hand] learning all the details and [thus] perhaps increasing the
perils to the client of disclosure." Moudy v. Superior Court (Alaska 1998).

Frank Griswold
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Office of the City Manager

o 491 East Pioneer Avenue
Clty Of H omer Homer, Alaska 99603
www.cityofhomer-ak.gov citymanager@cityofhomer-ak.gov
(p) 907-235-8121 x2222

(f) 907-235-3148

November 26,2014

Mr. Frank Griswold

519 Klondike

SUBJECT: Records Request dated 11/11/14

Dear Mr. Griswold:

Your records request dated 11/11/14 is approved. Please take note of the following;

1.
2.

Invoices for November have not yet been received. We expect to have them in several weeks.
July invoice. The July invoice was provided to you in response to a previous records request.
What you received contained redactions. Some of these redactions were deemed to be
confidential and others were redacted simply because they were not responsive to your

‘request. Your orjginal request was for documents showing who provided non-procedural

advice to the BOA on CUP 13-13 and who wrote the Record of Decision. We have reviewed the
July invoice again and determined that nothing needed to be redacted. A clean un-redacted
copy is enclosed.

June invoice: The enclosed June invoice contains an insert which describes work done on
CUP 13-13. This is responsive to your prior request. We regret that it was not provided to you
in response to your earlier records request. This insert was omitted when the June invoice
was sent to the City. We never saw it and did not pay it. We did not discover this until Birch,
Horton contacted us about an unpaid balance yesterday. | hope you will accept that this was
an honest mistake. The invoice contains no redactions.

Redactions and items not provided:

All time entries for litigation matters are omitted due to Attorney-Client privilege (HCC
2.84.040)

One redaction in the June 18 invoice regarding advice on a potential litigation matter. (HCC
2.84.040) ,

One redaction on the September 17 invoice concerning an on-going litigation matter.

W. Wrede 11/26/14
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15573‘1115;112?;5'?: N ANCHORAGE, ATASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
(Boz) 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184805

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 93603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014 11,311.87
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $11,311.87

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkxkkkkx* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **#kkdiik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added 1o amounts 60 days past due.

33



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 157?{;?:%; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(on 658350 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: B06742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184805

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 0018

City Council - General 2013-2014

05/05/14 T Klinkner .50 Draft April 2014 city attorney report
05/08/14 T Klinkner .60 Review agenda packet for 4/12 Council meeting
05/12/14 T Klinkner 4.50 Attend Council meetings

05/13/14 T Klinkner 2.00 Research projects following Council meeting

05/22/14 T Klinkner 1.00 Review agenda packet for 5/27 Council meeting;
draft message to J. Johnson regarding same

FEES $5,969.15

Disbursements

04/21/14 Airfare - re: T. Klinkner - Travel to Homer (NO NC CHARGE
CHARGE)

05/31/14 Computer Research 160.07

05/13/14 Airport Parking - re: T. Klinkner - Travel to NO CHARGE
Homer (NC CHARGE}

05/13/14 Hotel Accomodations - re: T. Klinkner - Travel 125.76
to Homer

05/13/14 Meal while on travel to Homer - Re: T. Klinknex 26.04
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1200
WASHINGTON, D.C. 2003% _ {907) 276-1550
(202} 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal ID. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
June 18, 2014

City Council - General 2013-2014

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $311.87

Total This Matter $11,311.87
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1020 .
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(202) 659-5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184806

491 Rast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0021 Ethics Complaint 14-03 0.00
Ethics Complaint 14-03

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE POR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

**k%k4%%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%¥dk%wkx

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO BN IRAV NS
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?gg ;n;gzrév NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oz 6325600 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184806

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 0021

Ethics Complaint 14-03

05/01/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Draft letter to complainant regarding ethics
= complaint 2014-03
05/15/14 T Klinkner .70 Research and draft memorandum to J. Johnson

regarding Board decision returning complaint
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
usmig; ;giaéf’r NV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 659-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184807

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0022 Ethics Complaint 14-04 thru 14-08 0.00
Ethics Complaint 14-04 thru 14-08 -
CURRENT CHARGES 50.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkxkkx PLEACE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #%%x¥kdkx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 59501
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1535:? éflg\;ﬁ'ﬁ MW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
faom) 35500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer _ June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managex Invoice # 184807

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 899603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014
Matter: 0022
Ethics Complaint 14-04 thru 14-08

05/01/14 T Klinkner .30 Draft letter to complainant regarding ethics
complaints 2014-04 through 2014-08
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 {907) 276-1550
(b02) €535806 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Hower June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184808

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014 14.32
City Clerk - General 2013-2014 -
CURRENT CHARGES : $14.32

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF DUTSTANDING INVOICES

kExAkdkx« PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***xk&dx%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

40



N

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1;{?; gsziﬂ» NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
4 525500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184808
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

05/16/14 T Klinkner .80 Draft ordinance amending Parks Commission
meeting schedule; research” and draft message to
J. Johnson regarding reappropriation of funds

for Public Works contract

05/19/14 T Klinkner +70 Analysis and drafting of response to F.Griswold
questions regarding ethics complaint

Disbursements

05/31/14 Computer Research 14.32
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $14.32

Total This Matter $14.32
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LAW OFFICES
'BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1-‘?{}?&@? N¥. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 _ {907) 276-1550

{202 4595800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184809
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0202 Public Records Requests 0.00
Public Records Requests -
CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF COUTBTANDING INVOICES

**%x***%* DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#kkkkkk*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due,
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 57H STREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
@02y 595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

PN

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184809
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 89603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014
Matter: 0202
Public Records Regquests

05/07/14 T Klinkner .30 Review F., Griswold messages regarding records
request; telephone conference with W. Wlede
regarding same

05/08/14 T Xlinkner i40 Review and redact billing statements in
response to F. Griswold records request; draft
message to W. Wrede regarding same

05/09/14 T Xlinkner .70 Review correspondence regarding F. Griswold
records requests

05/12/14 T Klinkner ;70 Review record request appeals; exchange of
messages with W. Wrede regarding same

05/15/14 T Klinkner 2.60 Assemble and review billing statements in
regponse to records request; exchanges of
messages with W. Wrede, et al. regarding same

05/16/14 T Klinkner .40 Complete redaction of invoices; draft message
to W. Wrede, et al. regarding same

05/30/14 T Klinkner .40 Respearch and draft message to W. Wrede

regarding public records requests for
surveillance video recoxdings
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LAW OFFICES :
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 STH STREET, .. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202 659-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal L.D. No. 92-0046806

Ciient: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184810

491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 City Manager - General 2013-2014 247.81
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $247.81

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUISTANDING INVOICES

kkkxdkksx PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***x&&kkadk

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO S B T AVENE
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 135;*; gl;;zom NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
@) 535800 FAX {907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

Ccity of Homer ' June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184810
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 89603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 0215

City Manager - General 2013-2014

05/01/14 J Lister 20 Coordinate with M. Sebring re: obtaining
samples of previous Request for Proposals for
cellphone services for city workers; forward to

T. Klinkner

05/01/14 M Sebring 1.90 Research existing Request for Proposals for
small city employee cell phone contracts

05/06/14 T Xlinkner .30 Review and respond to message from W. Wrede
regarding transfer of property to nonprofit
group

05/07/14 T Klinkner <10 Research regarding ordinance authorizing

property transfer

05/08/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research and draft documents for equestrian
‘ park land transfer '

05/09/14 T Klinkner 1.40 Research and draft conveyance of land for
eguestrian center; draft ordinance authorizing
same; draft message to W. Wrede, et al.
regarding same

05/21/14 T Klinkner 3. 00 e ER TR e e e
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BFITNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
154 1STH STREET, .. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
tenry eas5500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
June 18, 2014

City Manager - General 2013-2014

Disbursements
05/31/14 Computer Research 21.29
05/31/14 Computer Research 226.52

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $£247.81

Total This Matter $5247.81
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, NV. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (507) 276-1550
eon 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

TN

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184811

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0300 Personnel-General 0.00

Personnel-General

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*¥xkx*x4* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*%*%kk%x%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due,
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 11&* «;;E:;inﬁ NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
on 633800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184812

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 0.00
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES 50.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A& LIST OF OQUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkuhxk* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **&*%sku

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
56 STH STREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(207 59 5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.DD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager , Invoice # 184812

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homeyr, AK S9603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014
Matter: 0563
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

05/08/14 T Klinkner .10 Exchange of messages with J. Johnson, et al.
regarding tower ordinance

05/27/14 T Klinkner .20 Review notice of appeal from approval of CUP
14-05
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 {5TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1620 -
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907 276-1550

{202) 6595800

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184813

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, BRK 938603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0565 XKodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appea 15.00
Kodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal

CURRENT CHARGES $15.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR 2 LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kk%k**k* DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DAYMENT ##*k&*x&i%k

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added 1o amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15‘1;*;;??23;”: MW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
R 6555500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184813

491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Serviceg Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 0565

XKodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal

05/01/14 T Klinkger .60 Research and draft Board of Adjustment decision

05/05/14 T Klinkner 2.90 Research and draft Board of Adjustment decision

Disbursements

04/16/14 Airport Parking - re: T. Xlinkner - Travel to 15.00
Homer

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $15.00

Total This Matter $15.00
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.V, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907} 276-1550
o e FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184814

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, RK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 617 .45
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 ~
CURRENT CHARGES $617.45

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

#xkx*%**% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#*kkkkik

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO T S N Y eoror
Please note, there will be 4.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1535;}1{ ;1‘;213’1" DLW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGYON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
eor) 525803 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

N

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184814
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, RK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014
Matter: 0566
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

05/01/14 H Wells 1.80 Conduct research regarding appeal rights on
partial femand; outline decision

05/06/14 H Wells 1.70 Review and organize notes; telephone conference
with clerk regarding procedural matters;
initiate decision draft

05/08/14 H Wells 2.60 Meeting with P. Crowe regarding hearing record;
review hearing recoxrd

05/12/14 H Wells .40 Email correspondence and meeting with M. McNabb
regarding hearing record and decision

05/13/14 M McNabb 7.00 Review City Code provisions regarding
conditional use permits; listen to CD of oral
argument before Board of Adjustment; review
Board's findings, parties' briefs, Planming
Commission's decision and other documents of
record; draft findings of Board of Adjustment
as to procedural issues raised by appellant
Griswold

05/14/14 M McNabb .10 Conference with H. Wells regarding status of
draft findings of Board of Adjustment
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 iﬁ; :‘t}'z:c""‘ NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
(202} 653350 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2
City of Homer

June 18, 2014
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

05/14/14 H Wells 3.20 Draft decision and review Board's notes and
directions regarding same

05/15/14 H Wells 2.60 Draft decision and review Board's notes and
direction regarding same

05/22/14 H Wells 3.90 Draft written decision; review notes and Board
direction

05/23/14 H Wells 2.90 Draft Decision; review Board's notes and
direction; review relevan® portions of the
record

05/27/14 H Wells .10 Review Notice of Appeal filed by F. Griswold;

conduct preliminary research regarding standing

05/28/14 H Wells 3.60 Draft written decision; review Board notes and
relevant portions of the record

05/29/14 M McNabb .70 Conference with H. Wells regarding drafting
Board of Adjustment’'s decision as to procedural
issues; review City Code provigions regarding
standing to appeal, entries of appearance,
submission of briefs; review Attormney General's
opinion regarding whether presenting cases as
administrative hearings by non-attorney agency
staff members constitutes practice of law;
review case law regarding permissibility of
dual representation; draft decision findings
regarding conflicts of interest, ex parte
communications, and right of appearance and
standing; email draft to H. Wells

05/29/14 H Wells 5.80 Draft written decision; review relevant portion
of the record and Board's notes and direction
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
HS¢ THSTREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
o) 53800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 3

City of Homer
June 18, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

05/30/14 M McNabb 7.60 Review email from H. Wells regarding Board of
Adjustment’s draft decision; review revised
draft decision; assist H. Wells in drafting
Board's decision ag to substantive issues;
review final draft and make minor changes;
emaill draft decision to Mayor and Board members

05/30/14 H Wells 5.40 Draft written decision; review notes and Board
direction
Disbursements
05/31/14 Computer Research 617.45
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $617.45
Total This Matter 5617.45
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
S STHSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 63%-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer June 18, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managexr Invoice # 184815
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 92603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014 0.00
Port & Harbor -~ General 2013-2014 -
CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A& LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

#*%kk4k** PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DPAYMENT **%k&kik%

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO TR ENTH AVENLE
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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1156 1STH STREET, NW.
SUITE 1020

LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ATASKA 99501

WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005

{202} 6393300

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184815

491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK

99603

June 18, 2014

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

Matter: 1331

Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

05/01/14 T

05/02/14 T

05/02/14 H

05/05/14 H

05/06/14 T

05/13/14 T

05/13/14 T

Klinkner

Klinkner

Wells

Wells

Klinkner

Klinkner

Klinkner

1.80

.20

2.10

.60

.10

.30

Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
seller financing of lease assignment; draft
agreement among City, seller and buyer
regarding same

Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
modification of letter to leasehold assignor
and assignee; draft revisions to same

Telephone conference and email correspondence
with B. Hawkins regarding Stall lease policies
and moorage agreements; conduct research
regarding same

Locate and review moorage agreements

Exchange of emails regarding maintenance of
oil/water separator on AHMS leasehold

Review messages, additional documents regarding
Happy Face restaurant lease assignment;

conference with A. Browning regarding same

Exchange of messages with A. Browning regarding
Happy Face lease assignment
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 153;‘;3?{2?' N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (507) 276-1550

{202) 6535800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184899

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014 11,001.490
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES 511,001.40

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

**kkx%%%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **%%**%k%

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO T SR EN T AVENCE
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?glf’;g;i“ N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHING TON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
EEnesss FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184899
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0018
City Council - General 2013-2014

06/05/14 T Klinkner 2.80 Draft May 2014 city attorney report; review
agenda packet for 6/9 Council meeting and draft
message to J. Johnson regarding same; review
recent U.S8. Supreme Court regarding invocation
at Council meeting

06/06/14 T Klinkner +30 Follow-up with H. Wells on issues for Council
meeting
06/06/14 H Wells 2.60 Prepare for City Council meeting; review

packet; review Supreme Court case precedent and
Alaska Laws regarding prayer in
council/government meetings

06/08/14 H Wells 1.20 Continue preparing for City Council meeting

06/09/14 H Wells 7.30 Attend Homer City Council meeting; meeting with
W. Wrede regarding same

06/19/14 T Klinkner .60 Review agenda packet for 6/23 Council meeting
06/20/14 T Klinkner .20 Review agenda packet for 6/23 Council meeting
06/23/14 T Xlinkner .20 Review City Manager report for 6/23 Council
meeting
Total Hours 15.20
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 5TH STREET, NV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(bom) 6595500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 ‘ Page: 2

City of Homer
July 5, 2014

City Council - General 2013-2014

FEES $11,000.00
Disbursements
Postage ‘ 1.40
06/09/14 Air Fare: re: H. Wells travel to Homer (NO NO CHARGE
CHARGE)
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $1.40

x k k k k k Kk Kk Kk & % ATTORNEY SUMMARY * k k k k Kk * Kk k Kk %k

, Billed Hours Bill

Attorney Rateg: Per Hour . Worked Amount

T. F. Klinkner 723.68 4.10 ‘ 2967.08

H. C. Wells 723.69 11.10 8032.92
Total This Matter $11,001.40
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1156 15TH STREET, N.W.
SUITE 1020

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005
(202) 659-5800

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184900

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014¢

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

July 9, 2014

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkkkkx PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#%*dddd%

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO B B ENTH AVENDE
Please note, there will be 4.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
H56 STHSTREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(ORE5535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal ILD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184900

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, BK 88603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

06/18/14 T Klinkner .90 Research and draft ordinance amending Code
provigions regarding Planning Commission review

of subdivisions

06/18/14 T Klinkner .40 Research regarding charter commission election;
draft message to J. Johnson regarding same

62



LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ‘i’l{;‘ TSETT;;?T N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
20z} 593800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184901

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 95603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 City Manager -~ General 2013-2014 0.00
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

Ak kdkkkkik PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #¥%&kkk¥ik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?g;z ;Tlizim NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(b0 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184901

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 9%603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0215
City Manager - General 2013-2014

06/04/14 T Klinkner .20 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
- records request, Kachemak sewer agreement
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
HS4 ISTH STREET, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D1.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
o 653.5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184902

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0300 Personnel-General ’ 0.00
Personnel-Geferal

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*hkkkkihks DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *¥®%k*%k¥

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?L;;}; f’l;g;éﬁ’ﬁ A A ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550

{202) 6595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1D, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 1849502

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homey, AK 89603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

Matter: 0300

Personnel-General

06/23/14 T Klinkner .30 Review exchange of messages regarding ethics
complaint against City employee; review

procedure for same

06/25/14 T Klinkner .60 Review materials for ethics committee meeting

66



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1136 19‘;{;;;:};2;1;" NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
a0z 6535500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-00468C6

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184903

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 938603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 21.65
Planning/Development - General 2313-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $21.65

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QOUTSTANDING INVOICES

Akxkx**4% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **kkkkkkx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?ﬁ;:ﬁggx NV ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (307) 276-1550
oy e300 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184903

491 East Pioneer Avenuse
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0563
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

06/23/14 T Klinkner 1.20 Research and draft message to R. Abboud
regarding permit issulnce and zoning vioclations

06/27/14 T Klinkner 1.30 Resgearch regarding standards for zoning permit
issuance; draft message to R. Abboud regarding
same

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research 21.65

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $21.65

Total This Matter $21.65
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ’5;';5&251 N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
fom 6595300 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184904

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0565 Kodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appea 178.74
Kodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal

CURRENT CHARGES $178.74

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*xdkx%%*%x DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DPAYMENT **#%%%sh*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO T SN AVENTLE
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 lfgggggiﬁ'ﬁ”m- ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
3 L 102
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

(202} 6595800

FAX {907) 258-1726

Client: 506742

City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Inveice # 184904
491 RBast Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 938603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

Matter: »(3565

Kodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal

06/06/14 T Klinkner 2.10 Review P. Weidner letter; research and draft

response to same; telephone conference with W.
Wrede regarding P. Weidner letter and response

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research 178,74
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ) $178.74

Total This Matter $178.74
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TN

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 12{*;]3$§§TNW ' ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(hcz) 595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184905

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 938603

For Profesgsional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 23.62
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

CURRENT CHARGES $23.62

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

¥kkkkkxkd PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **¥%kkddi

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1;5{—“;:’;?;13’13 A2 ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTOR, DG 20005 _ (907) 276-1550
402 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer ' July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Iinvoice # 184905
491 Bast Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AKX 85603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0566
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

06/02/14 M McNabb 1.50 Conference with H. Wells regarding drafting
Board of Adjustment decision; review and
analyze City Code regarding definition of ex
parte, appeal rights, necessity of "notice of
appeal" language in decision, definition of
*final decigion,” and whether decision is final
decision; review final draft of decision; email
H. Wells regarding comments on final draft of
decision

06/02/14 H Wells 2.80 Revise and finalize written decision; email
correspondence with M. Jacobsen and Mayor
regarding same; conduct research regarding
related procedural matters

06/03/14 H Wells 1.10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
written decision; conduct research regarding

finality of decision partially remanded

06/04/14 H Wells 1.90 Revise written decision; telephone conference
with J. Johnson regarding same

06/05/14 H Wells .40 Review Written Decision and telephone
conference with M. Jacobson regarding same
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

» 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 135:;;;‘1'52?73 NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
e 6950 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
July 9, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

06/06/14 H Wells .60 Revisions to written decision; telephone
conference with J. Johnson regarding same

06/09/14 H Wells .90 Advise Board prior to deliberations regarding
procedure for considering post hearing motions;
review Motion for Reconsideration regarding
procedural points for reconsideration

06/10/14 H Wells 1.20 Meeting with D. Gross regarding procedure for
post hearing motions; conduct research
regarding due process obligations

06/11/14 H Wells 1.90 Draft Order regarding reconsideration based
uypon Board direction; meeting with D. Gross
regarding same; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding same

06/16/14 H Wells .40 Email correspondence with P. Crowe/J. Johnson
regarding service of post hearing motions

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research . 23.62
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $23.62

iotal This Matter $23.62
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 Iijg{ﬁgf;i?}“‘v‘”‘ ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
{0z 6525500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184906

491 Fast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 93603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHBDRGES:
Matter: 0567 Appeal of CUP 14-05 1,301.20
Appeal of CUP 14-05

CURRENT CHARGES $1,301.20

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

*khxkkk*k DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **#kk#

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO N SV ENTHAVENCE
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1136 2551}?. ::;;ET N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
Bor) 6292800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184906

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0567

Appeal of CUP 14-05

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research 1301.20
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $1,301.20

Total This Mattex | $1,301.20
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;??;%?' N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
faon) 6595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184907

491 Bast Pioneer Avenus
Homer, AK 989603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0900 Library General 23.62
Library General

CURRENT CHARGES $23.62

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*#x%%xe%sr DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%*#k% ik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ATASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1;11;;{?;37 N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D,C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
frony 555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184907

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 29603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014
Matter: 0900

Library General

06/20/14 T Klinkner .40 Research and draft mesgage to W. Wrede
regarding use of e-cigarattes in City buildings

Disbursements
06/30/14 Computer Research 23.62

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $23.62

Total This Matter £$23.62
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115612"&"_5550‘5;1“""- ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, 1.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
e esnas FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.1, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer July 2, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184908

491 East_ Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 93603

For Professional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - Generxal 2013-2014 159.06
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

- CURRENT CHARGES $159.06

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING IRVOICES

**kx% %% %% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DAYMENT #%%k#ikik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 lsﬁé;i;ﬁiﬁNW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, I1.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
(po) 6535500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184908
491 Eagt Pioneer Avenue ,

Homer, AK 99603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through June 30, 2014

Matter: 1331
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

06/03/14 H Wells 1.60 Revise stall agreement and researched stall
leasing policies, identify missing information,
and email correspondence with B. Hawkins
regarding same

06/03/14 H Wells ;80 Telephone conference with B. Hawkins regarding
Bucaneer Bankruptcy implications; meeting with
M. McNabb regarding same

06/06/14 M McNabb 1.20 Teleconference with H. Wells regarding
bankruptcy filing by Buccaneer entities and
possible creditor status of City of Homer;
research bankruptcy filing records; review
bankruptcy court dockets for Buccaneer Chapter
11 entities; review bankruptcy filings
regarding extension of time to file debtors’
schedules and statements; email H. Wells

06/06/14 H Wells .40 Email correspondence and meeting with M. McNabb
regarding Bucaneer Bankruptcy deadlines

06/10/14 M McNabb 10 Review article in "Petroleum News" regarding
Buccaneer bankruptcy £ilings

06/11/14 A Limeres .20 Analysis and confer with H. Wells regarding
assignment clauses in mooring agreements
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1156 13TH STREET, N.W.
SUITE {028

LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

WASHINGTOM, D.C, 20005

(202 6595800

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Pages: 2

July 9, 2014

Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

06/16/14 L

06/16/14 H

06/17/14 L

06/17/14 H

06/18/14 H

06/19/14 H

06/20/14 T

06/20/14 H

06/23/14 T

Haacke

Wells

Haacke

Wells

Wells

Wells

Klinknerx

Wells

Klinkner

1.

oo

.90

.60

.20

.80

.80

480

+40

.50

Research lease language regarding no sublease
provision; confer with H. Wells regarding same

Finalize revisions to stall agreement and
regerve stall lease policies; conduct reseaxch
regarding constitutional limitations and equal
protection issues

Locate sublease restriction language and
forward to H. Wells for review

Telephone conference with B. Hawkins regarding
stall leasing policieg and other Harbor issues;
conduct research regarding same

Telephone conference with B, Hawkins regarding
revigions to stall lease agreements and legal
vulnerabilities regaxrding same

Finalize revisions to stall lease agreement;
meeting with A. Limeres regarding same; email

correspondence with B. Hawkins regarding same

Regsearch and draft confidentiality agreement
with SpitwSpots

Research sublease prchibition provisions;
meeting with L. Haacke regarding same

Draft confidentiality agreement
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1156 15TH STREET, NW.
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005
{202) 6555850

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Howmer

Page: 3

July 2, 2014

Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

Disbursements

06/30/14 Computer Research 159.06
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $159.06

Total This Matter $159.06
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
$156 15TH STREET, N.W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fom) 6335509 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185109

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AKX 89603

For Professional Bervices Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014 11,000.00
City Courrtil - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $£11,000.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*xkkskx%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **¥hkkki%

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO A N N A
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added ro amounts 60 days past due.
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- LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15T?Li$§f‘i§§5 NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
(eon) 6535860 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 508742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185109

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

Matter: 0018

City Council - General 2013-2014

07/07/14 T Klinkner .50 Draft city attorney report for June 2014

07/22/14 H Wells +60 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
upcoming City Council meeting and general
procedural issues in Board of Adjustment

proceedings

07/24/14 T Klinkner 1.20 Review agenda packet for 7/28 Council meeting;
draft message to J. Johnson regarding same

07/28/14 T Klinkner 5.00 Meetings at City Hall on pending issues; attend
City Council meetings

FEES $11,000.00

06/25/14 Airfare - re: T. Klinkner - Travel to Homer (NO NO CHARGE
CHARGE)

Total This Matter $11,000.00
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1STH STREET, NI, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 3020 :
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
on st FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-00468C6

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185110

491 East Pioneerxr Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603
L2

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0020 Ethics Complaint 14-02 0.00
Ethics Complaint 14-02 -
CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

k%% #x%%%+ PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #¥%#*#kkdk#

; 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 151'2;5{1;1;&;52‘6 N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 26005 (907) 276-1550
faom) 6535800  FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185110

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, 2K 99603

For Professional Sexvices Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 0020
Ethics Complaint 14-02

07/25/14 T Klinkner .10 Exchange of messages with J. Johnson regarding
” Board response to complaint
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
S STHSTREET 0¥, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, I.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6595800

FAaX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 508742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185111

431 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 95603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014 33.17
City Clerk - General 2013-2014 -
CURRENT CHARGES $33.17

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FPOR A LIST OF QUISTANDING INVOICES

*x*%%k%%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT %%k

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added o amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ISTHSTREET, LW, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005
(202} 659-5800

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

August 8, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185111

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homeyr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

07/16/14 T Klinkner 1.00

07/17/14 T Klinkner 2.90

07/31/14 T Klinkner .20
07/31/14 T Klinkner .70
Disbursements

07/31/14 Computer Research

Research and draft resoclution calling charter
commission electidn; draft message to M.
Jacobsen regarding same

Regsearch and draft resgolution calling charter
commission election; exchange of messages with
M. Jacobsen regarding same; research and draft
ordinance prohibiting e-cigarettes in public
buildings

Review message from A. Dixon regarding
e-cigarette research

Research and draft message to M. Jacobsen
regarding application by representative for
absentee ballot

33.17
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $33.17
Total This Mattex $33.17
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
S STHTRSST, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(paz 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: " 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Involice # 185112

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 939603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHRRGES:

Matter: 0215 City Manager - General 2013-2014 0.00
City Manager - General 2013-2014 -
CURRENT CHARGES . §0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A& LIST OF QUISTANDING INVOICES

*k%k%kk%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%k%kkki#

g 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ’STIS{[;I?;??; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
| Gen e FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185112

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 992603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 02158
City Manager - General 2013-2014

07/15/14 T Klinkner .40 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
pending projects

07/18/14 T Klinkner 70 Research and draft message to W. Wrede

regarding procurement advertising; research
regarding procurement code revision
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1320
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20008 (907) 276-1550

{202) 659-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer ’ August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managex Invoice # 185113

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homey, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0300 Personnel-General 0.00
Personnel-General -
CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kxkkkkkkk PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #%&kiaidkx

‘ 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 mgj sgrg; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oz 655380 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185113

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 0300

Persomnel-General

07/02/14 T Klinkner .10 Review letter from W. Wrede regarding ethics
complaint
07/16/14 A Limeres 1.20 Analysis, review offer letter and email chain,

and telephone conference with W. Wrede
regarding rehire issues; analysis and research
regarding extension of probationary period and
draft email memorandum summarizing same for W.
Wrede
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;?:;’?;? W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D:C. 20005 {907) 276-1550

{207) 639-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managerxr Invoice # 185114

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homeyr, AK 93603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 107.80
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 -
CURRENT CHARGES $107.80

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FCR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

#**%%%*4* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***k##kk%

- 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 59501
Please note, there will be 2 ,88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 STHSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
o isxsin FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185114

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

Matter: 0563

Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

07/14/14 T Klinkner .40 Review correspondence regarding remand of CUP

13-13; telephone conferehce with R. Abboud
regarding same

07/15/14 T Klinkner 2.30 Research and draft memorandum regarding effect
of zoning violations on conditional use
application

07/16/14 T Klinkner 1.70 Research and draft message to R. Abboud
regarding regulation of towers as conditional
uses

07/17/14 T Klinkner 1.00 Research regarding tower regulation

07/18/14 T Klinkner 1.80 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud

regarding tower regulation

07/21/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding tower regulation

07/23/14 T Xlinkner 1.20 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding tower regulation

07/24/14 T Klinkner 1.30 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding tower regulation
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15’1?U?Ti;1~1§;%w ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6593800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2
City of Homer
August 8, 2014
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014
07/30/14 T Klinkner 2.00 Research and draft Code amendment regarding
: City Planner participation in Beoard of

Adjustment appeals; research and draft
memorandum regarding same

Disbursements
07/31/14 Computer Research 107.80

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $107.80

Total This Matter $107.80
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;{}” I‘I‘SgR;OEZET. N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {507) 276-1550
fhomy 6593800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. INo. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185115

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0700 Police Department ~ General 0.00
Police Department - General

CURRENT CHARGES ’ $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkkwkxi PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *dkxdddx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

95



LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15’1’:1 fo?rziigo BV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 26005 (907) 276-1550

{202} 659-5800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185115
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 899603

For Professional Sexrvices Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 0700
Police Department - General

07/01/14 T Klinkner 1.60 Resecarch and draft message to M. Roble
regarding citation procedure changes
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.

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1551';532511\:.\1 ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fh02) 6595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer - August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185116

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

§

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0800 Public Works Department-General 0.00
Public Works Department-General

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUISTANDING INVOICES

*x%k%k*%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT % k%%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
s TESTRBET 5. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 {907) 276-1550

{202) 655-5860

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185116

491 FEast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

Matter: 0800

Public Works Department-General

07/25/14 T Klinkner .4Q Research and draft message to C. Meyer

regarding conditioning plat approval on
non-objection for formation of LID
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N

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
H STHSTREET, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@02) e555400 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
Ccity of Homer ' August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185117

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1100 Water Fund - General - 0.00

Water Fund - General

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*k%wkk4x% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **%#*kkk#

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO RN AYEE

Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
54 1TH STREET, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550
e érpssn FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185117

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 1100

Water Fund - General

07/08/14 T Xlinkner 1.70 Draft contract to purchase property for water
- tank site
07/09/14 T Klinkner 2.00 Draft purchase agreement for water tank site
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1553“1«_9;1:;21 N9 ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(o) 52580 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185118

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1312 Ferry Terminal - Alaska Marine Highway 0.00
Ferry Terminal - Alaska Marine Highway

CURRENT CHRRGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkx**%%* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#* k%%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 mT?uSrli"?E;Nm ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
oz 653550 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice $# 185118

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 929603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 1312
Ferry Terminal - Alaska Marine Highway

07/03/14 T Klinkner .40 Research and draft comments on B. Hawkins
- letter regarding AMHS employee parking

07/22/14 T Xlinkner .60 Review and comment on memorandum of agreement

with AMHS regarding dock improvements; revise
resclution authorizing same
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;21;1{1?;?01’;*;7‘: N.w. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
20z} 593800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 929603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014
Port & Harbor -~ General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

August 8, 2014
Invoice # 185119

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*%%xkx*%** DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **#%xk%#

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1620
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
20a) 655800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185119

491 East Piconeer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Profesgsional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014
Matter: 1331
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

07/09/14 H Wells .30 Email correspondence with M. McNabb regarding
Bucaneer Bankruptcy

07/21/14 T Xlinkner 70 Revige resolution regarding lease committee
procedure
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~

. LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1136 ’5;}?5:13052?1 Nw. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 2761550
(gom) e53.5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185120

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0567 Appeal of CUP 14-05 0.00

Appeal of CUP 14-05

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*%%%x%¥%%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***%*%*k%

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO L Y EN T AVENDE

Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

1156 15TH STREET, MW,
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005
{202) 65%-5800

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

August 8, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185120

491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014

Matter: 0567
Appeal of CUP 14-05

07/18/14 H Wells

07/21/14 H Wells

07/28/14 H Wells

07/29/14 H Wells

07/30/14 H Wells

.60

.10

.10

.60

.90

Telephone conference with M. Jacobsen regarding
procedural matters; conduct research regarding
same

Conduct research regarding procedural matters;
email correspondence and telephone conference
with J. Johnson regarding same

Review opening briefs; conduct preliminary
procedural resesarch

Review filings/briefs submitted by Planning
Department

Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding

procedural matters and request for continuance;
conduct research regarding same
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N

LAY OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.¥, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE w0
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
o) dsvstee FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 Bast Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

September 17, 2014
Invoice # 185403

11,823.94

$11,823.94

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkxdkx PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#*¥%ki&k

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

107



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 STHSTRELT, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550

(202) 6555809 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer Septembexr 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185403

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homey, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 0018

City Council - General 2013-2014

08/06/14 T Klinkner .70 Draft July 2014 city attorney report

08/07/14 T Klinkner .60 Review agenda packet for 8/11 Councii.meeting
08/15/14 T Klinkner +10 Sign ordinances

08/20/14 A Limeres .30 Bnalysis and review social media policy

provisions regarding controlling speech and
compliance with public recoxds laws

08/21/14 T Klinkner 1.30 Review agenda packet for August 25 Council
meeting; draft message to J. Johnson regarding
same

08/21/14 A Limeres 2.20 Analysis and research concerning employment

issues related to social media site; analysis
and draft language for social media policy
regarding same; analysis and confer with H.
Wells regarding same

08/21/14 H Wells 2.80 Review council agenda and packet; review
wastewater agreement and files regarding plat
approval process and council's reole in the
process
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LAY OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15'ns~1 [;?r*x;rifgz} NW, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 (907) 276-1550
faom) 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

City Council - General 2013-2014

08/22/14 H Wells 1.90 Prepare for council meeting

FEES

Disbursements
07/23/14 Airfare - re: H. Wells - Travel to Homer on
08/13/14 (NO CHARGE)
08/31/14 Computer Research
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

Total This Matter

109

Page: 2

September 17, 2014

$11,550.00

NO CHARGE
- 273.94
$273.94

$11,823.94



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 STHSTREEL, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 2761550

(202) 6395800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. $2-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185404

491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0101 C(City Clerk - General 2013-2014 0.00
City Clerk - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kx%k%%%*%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ##k#ki%*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 miisﬁz;; NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
or) 335800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185404

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 3992603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 0101

City Clerk - Generxral 2013-2014

08/05/14 T Klinkner .10 Exchange of megsages with J. Johnson, et al.
regarding attendance at work session on charter
commission

08/07/14 T Klinkner .10 Exchange of messages with J. Johnson regarding

B. Burgess notice of doing business with City

08/11/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research and draft message to J. Johnson
regarding effect of spouse's Planning
Commission membership on candidacy for Council;
attend Council work session on charter
commission issues

08/12/14 T Klinkner «10 BExchange of messages with J. Johnson regaxrding
form of ballot for charter commission
proposition

08/13/14 T Klinkner +40 Draft summary of charter election proposition

08/18/14 T Xlinkner <10 Review form of ballot for Octcber 2014 election

08/28/14 T Klinkner +10 Review and respond to message from J. Johnson
regarding press inguiries about home rule
issues
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;&; ;g?;ir N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550

(202} 6555800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 89603

For Professional Serwvices Rendered Through August 31,

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0205 Enstar Service to Homer
Enstar Service to Homer

CURRENT CHARGES

September 17, 2014
Invoice # 185405

2014

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUISTANDING INVOICES

#*%%%4+k%* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ****#x&*x

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 xsrgxééxgii; NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 9950.1
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(202 e59.%00 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer ' September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185405

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 0205
Enstar Service to Homer

08/13/24 T XKlinkner .50 Review and respond to criticism of per-lot
assegsment method

08/20/14 T Xlinkner .30 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
assessment methods

08/21/14 T Klinkner .10 Telephone conference with C. Thompson regarding
natural gas assessment methods
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1 5;;;1 ;’gx;iz‘é'r, NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
o) 6583900 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. INo. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 City Manager - General 2013-2014
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

September 17, 2014
Invoice # 185406

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

Wkkkkkkxx DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **%kd¥idk

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be a .88% per month lare charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1m;J sg;“;;; N.W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907} 276-1550C
oz 6535500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185406
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

Matter: 0215

City Manager ~ General 2013-2014

08/07/14 H Wells 3.20 Conduct research regarding social media policy
draft and email correspondence with W. Wrede
and T. Klinkner regarding same

08/08/14 T Klinkner .50 Review decision regarding Kenai Borough sales
tax local option referendum; draft message to

W. Wrede regarding same

08/12/14 H Wells .60 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
social media policy

08/14/14 H Wells 2.60 Conduct research regarding social media; draft
social media policy; conduct research regarding
same

08/21/14 H Wells 2.90 Conduct research regarding constitutional

issues surrounding social wedia; meeting with
A. Limeres regarding same

08/22/14 T Klinkner 1.70 Review of materials for social media
presentation
08/22/14 A Limeres .40 Analysis and review social wmedia policy and

confer with H. Wells regarding same
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE

1156 I5TH STREET, N.W.

SUITE 1200

WASHINGTON, D.C, 20036

(202) 659-5800

ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client:

506742

City of Homerxr

City Manager - General

08/22/14

08/25/14

08/25/14
08/26/14

08/26/14

08/28/14

H Wells

T Klinkner

H Wells

T Klinkner

H WeIls

H Wells

2013~

3.20

.30

.40

.40

Page: 2

September 17, 2014

2014

Finalize social media policy, working group
agenda and relevant exhibits

Review materials regarding social media legal
issues

Prepare for and attend city council meeting
Research social media legal issues

Meeting with T. Klinkner regarding council
meeting and resulting tasks

Meeting with T. Klinkner regarding status of
City projects
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
“5515;2{1‘53052?» N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@z e53-58c0 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185407
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AKX 29603

For Professional Sexrvices Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0300 Personnel-General .00
Personnel -General

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkkdxr PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT raikkiddix

- 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
56 THSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, .G, 20005 (907) 276-1550

{207 6595800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Involice # 185407
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 98603

For Professional Sexvices Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 0300
Personnel-General
08/20/14 A Limeres +40 Analysis and review email from W. Wrede
~ regarding light duty issues; analysis and

telephone conference with A. Peterson regarding
same
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{paz) 6e5.500 FAX (907) 258-1726
: Federal 1D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer Septembexr 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185408
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 86.78
Planning/Development - General™2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $86.78

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*xkxkxkx*x DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*#*%%%kk¥¥

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 157‘;5}:2“;2; Nw ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, I1.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fon e FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185408
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

Matter: 0563

Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

08/04/14 T Klinkner +40 Draft revised ordinance regarding Council S
review of Planning €ommission subdivision

regulations; exchange of messages with W. Wrede
regarding same

08/05/14 T Klinkner .20 Analysis regarding tower regulation

08/05/14 T Klinkner .20 Analysis regarding Board of Adjustment
representation

08/20/14 T Klinkner 2.50 Research and draft ordinances revising zoning

permit standards, conditional use standards

08/21/14 T Xlinkner 2.20 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding conditional use criteria

08/22/14 T Klinkner 2.10 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding conditional use standards

08/25/14 T Klinkner .50 Research and draft memorandum to R. Abboud
regarding conditional use standards

08/26/14 T Klinkner .70 Research and draft memorandum to R. Bbboud
regarding conditiconal use standards
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
usmsTﬁfnT;Iig;N.w ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 {907) 276-1550
| {om)esnae0 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Pages: 2

City of Homer
September 17, 2014

Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

Disbursements
08/31/14 Computer Research 86.78
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $86.78
Total This Matter $86.78
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;'{?:;?;1;7: N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
() 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager ' Invoice # 185409

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0567 Appeal of CUP 14-05 0.00
Appeal of CUP 14-05 -
CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LABT PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING IRVOICES

kkkkkxkhrx PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*%kakdiik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15"“; ;;‘3;?;;50 N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@0r) 655350 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

o~

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185409
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

Mattexr: 0567

Appeal of CUP 14-05

08/04/14 H Wells 3.20 Meeting with J. Johnson regarding Motion for
Continuance; provide procedural guidance

regarding process for hearing motion; conduct
research regarding same

08/05/14 H Wells 1.30 Scribe Motion for Continuance and email
correspondence with J. Johnson regarding same

08/12/14 H Wel W

08/27/14 H Wells 1.80 Review briefing and hearing schedule
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115 STH STREET, N. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
on) 558 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal LD, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185410

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 935603

Por Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0800 Public Works Department-General 14.15
Public Works Department-General

CURRENT CHARGES $14.15

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*xkkxxdkx PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *¥*®kkxd%%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 59501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15'1‘? ;r’x;ézlg; Nw, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(a0r) 595500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager . Invoice # 185410

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professzional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 0800
Public Works Department-General

08/15/14 T Klinkner .80 Research and draft message to C. Meyer

regarding Davis Bacon wage requirement for

clearing contract

Disbursements
08/31/14 Computer Research

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

Total This Matter

125

14.15
$14.15

$14.15



LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115512&*5;;‘;5& NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202} 6595800

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal LD. No. 920046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AX 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 1200 Sewer Fund-General

Sewer Fund-General

CURRENT CHARGES

September 17, 2014
Invoice # 185411

£0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*ukkkkxkk PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **&di&xdk

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO S SRV ENTHAVENSE
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added vo amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15?; ;ng;%:o N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(e 993800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185411

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014
Matter: 1200
Sewer Fund-General

08/13/14 T Klinkner 3.70 Research and draft revision of sewer service
agreement with Xachemak

08/14/14 T Klinkner s20 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
Kachemak wastewater agreement

08/15/14 T Xlinkner .90 Draft revisions to Kachemak wastewater gervice
contract; draft message to W. Wrede regarding
same

08/18/14 T Xlinkner 10 Review City Manager memorandum regarding

Kachemak wastewater agreement

08/13/14 T Klinkner .30 Review Kachemak comments on Kachemak wastewater
agreement
08/20/14 T Klinkner 1.40 Draft revisions to Kachemak wastewater

agreement; telephone conference with W. Wrede
regarding same

08/21/14 T Xlinkner .30 Draft revisions to Kachemak wastewater
agreement
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 5T STREET, NV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(o) 555500 FAX (507) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

September 17, 2014
Invoice # 185412

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDIRG INVOICES

*hkmekwdhhk DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%*¥diii®

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be & ,88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
154 15TH STREET, N7, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (307) 276-1550
oz ez sie FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185412

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

Matter: 1331

Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

08/11/14 H Wells .90 Email correspondence with B. Hawkins regarding
reserve stall agreement; review latest

revisions in preparation for discussions

08/18/14 H Wells .30 Telephone conference with B. Hawkins regarding
rosewood stall agreement revisions
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
15 1STH STREET, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oz esss800 ‘ FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, BK 89603

Por Professional Services Rendered Through September 30,

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

October 13, 2014
Invoice # 185569

2014

11,925.00

$11,925.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkykxk4*x PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **k%dhikid#

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115 15’”;“ 5;3;1’;1;; N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fron 595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

city of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185569
491 East Piloneer Avenue

Homer, AKX 59603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

Matter: 0018
City Council - General 2013-2014

09/02/14 H Wells 1.10 Initiate preparation of City Attorney Report;
” follow up on outstanding projects for
discussion at upcoming Council meeting and
review synopses provided by T.Klinkner for
projects pending

09/03/14 A Limeres .20 Analysis and prepare monthly personnel advice
report to council per H. Wells

09/03/14 H Wells 1.40 Teleconference with Clerk's office regarding
outstanding matters for agenda; finalize City
Attorney Report and distribute to Clerk's
office

03/04/14 H Wells 1.80 Telephcone conference with W. Wrede regarding
taxation issues and research results regarding
taxation under the Agreement as well as way

forward
09/08/14 H Wells 6.10 Prepare for and attend City Council meetings
09/22/14 H Wells .60 Telephone conference with Clerk regarding

procedural matters for upcoming meeting

FEES $11,550.00
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1STH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SLATE 1200 ’
WASRINGTON, D.C. 20036 (507) 276-1550
on esvem FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
October 13, 2014

City Council -~ General 2013-2014

Disbursements

07/23/14 Airfare - re: H. Wells - Travel to Homer on NO CHARGE
08/25/14 {NO CHARGE)

09/04/14 Airfare to Homer - re: H. Wells . 240.00

09/05/14 Airfare - re: H. Wells 120.00

08/26/14 Parking Expense - re# H. Wells (NO CHARGE) NO CHARGE

09/09/14 Parking Expense - rei H. Wells 15.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $375.00

Total This Matter $11,925.00
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LAYW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
) 595500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185570
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014 0.00
City Clerk - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OQOUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkd¥¥* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ****%kxdx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99561
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 151":}51};?;552; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 {907) 276-1550
GonesRsm0 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185570

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 935603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

08/17/14 H Wells 1.30 Prepare amendment to ordinance regarding
chauffeur license fees; email correspondence
with J. Johnson regarding same

09/19/14 H Wells .80 Email correspondence with J. Johnson regarding
potential conflicts in City Code; conduct

research regarding same

09/25/14 T Klinkner .30 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
procedure for ¢ity manager recruitment
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LAW OFFICES |
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 za;j%rgﬁ’l NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 ’ (907) 276-1550
o esrsios FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer Cctober 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185571
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Profesgional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0205 Enstar Service to Homer 0.00
Enstar Service to Homer

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkkkxk PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#***ddidi

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO T SEVENTHAVENUE

Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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- LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 g?;ffi‘;m» MW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-155Q
fon gs3580 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185571

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

Matter: 0205

Enstar Service to Homer

09/24/14 S Hutchings 2.10 Contract review for H. Wells; tariff research;

work with H. Wells in connecticon with Enstar
issues
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
S0 STHSTREST, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
on ésasiio FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homex, AK 99603

October 13, 2014
Invoice # 185572

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 City Manager - General 2013-2014
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

#%%k*%%%* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT k% ki

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE .
1156 1;;;? ;’II‘;?T NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550

£202) 6555800

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185572

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 389603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014
Matter: 0215
City Manager - General 2013-2014

09/25/14 T Klinkner .40 Research and draft message to W. Wrede
regarding municipal firearms regulation -
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15513;1 sg?;gv NV ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@or) $535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 FEast Pioneer Avenue ‘
Homer, AK 98603

October 13, 2014
Invoice # 185873

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0451 Ocean Drive Loop Special Service Distric
Ocean Drive Loop Special Service District

CURRENT CHARGES

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkkk¥*x DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *¥%¥kkikk

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ?UT;;ST&%ET N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
oz} €53:5%00 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185573

491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014.
Matter: 0451

Ocean Drive Loop Special Service District

09/25/14 T Xlinkner .20 Research and draft message to W. Wrede

regarding exemption of property from special
tax district
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;311 fﬁﬁ‘" NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
teor) 635500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185574

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 0.00
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES , $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*Ekxkkdxik DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *d%kkkikik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
NS STHSTREET, O, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

(202) 659-5850

FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managexr Invoice # 185574

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 95603

For Professiocnal Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014
Matter: 0563
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

09/25/14 T Klinkner .80 Research and draft amendments to watershed
district regulations
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'LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 15TH STREET, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oo 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal ID. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185575
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0565 Kodiak Microwave System Cond*l Use Appea 0.00
Kodiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal

CURRENT CHARGES £0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

¥kkxkhi4k PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ¥*%kdkik%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES |
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 STHSTRERT, Y. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550
@02) 6523800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1D, No, 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer Octocber 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managexr Invoice # 185575
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 98603

For Professgional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014
Matter: 0565
¥odiak Microwave System Cond'l Use Appeal
09/09/14 H Wells 1.10 Review microwave tower appeal file and discuss
- need for correspondence responding to appellant
complaints in light of withdrawal of

application; telephone conferences with W.
Wrede and R. Bbboud regarding same
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
s STHISTREET, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 26005 (907) 276-1550
om 395800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185576
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0567 Appeal of CUP 14-05 214.66
Appeal of CUP 14-05

CURRENT CHARGES $214.66

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE POR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*%xkx%x%%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **## ks

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE .
1154 1575 STRERT, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, DiC:, 20005 (907) 276-1550
(o8 553500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer ' October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185576
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AKX 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Septembexr 30, 2014
Matter: 03567
Appeal of CUP 14-05

08/10/14 H Wells 1.60 Prepare for hearing; email correspondence with
~ J.Johnson regarding procedural matters and
correspondence with parties regarding
service/process guestions; prepare respounses to
expected procedural matters and BOA options

09/11/14 H Wells . 4.60 Prepare BOA script for hearing, including
mini-hearing procedures and potential
procedural issues; conduct necessary research
regarding various procedural matters; telephone
conference with M. Jaccbsen regarding same;
review entry of appearance/service issues
raised by Clerk

09/15/14 H Wells 2.80 Conduct research regarding guorum and
postponement of hearings as well as due process
obligations; telephone conferences with City
Clerk and City Manager regarding substantive
deliberations by BOA and BOA's needs
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LAW OFFICES _
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ISTH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oy 35800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
October 13, 2014

Appeal of CUP 14-05
Disbursements
09/30/14 Computer Research ' 214.66

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 5214 .66

Total This Matter $214.66
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal LD, No. 92-0046806

1156 15TH STREET, N.W.
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005
{202) 6595800

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homeyx, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30,

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 1200 Sewer Fund-General
sewer Fund-General -

CURRENT CHARGES

October 13, 2014
Invoice # 185577

2014

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkkxkd PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*#%kkdki¥

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
NCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

148



P ~.

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1:&*; gs'géiﬁ'f S NW, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
{acr) 6525800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185577
491 BEast Pioneer Avenue :

Homer, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2014

Matter: 1200
Sewer Fund-General

09/03/14 H Wells 5.40 Conduct research regarding federal, state, and
local tax laws and issues concerning taxation
from point of sale and rate provisions in
Agreement raised by City Manager and Council
Members
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 li;fgfgfii?’ N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D,C. 20005 (907} 276-1550
op 550 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Picneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31,

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

November 12, 2014
Inveoice # 185769

2014

11,640.00

$11,640.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kk%xkxx% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ****#kik*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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1156 15TH STREET, N.W,
SUITE 1020

LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005

{202} 659-5800

(907) 276-1550
FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal IL.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185769

451 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AKX

98603

November 12, 2014

1
/

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

Matter: 0018

City Council - General 2013-2014

10/06/14 H Wells

10/07/14 T
10/09/14 T

10/13/14 T

i0/20/14 T

10/23/14 T

10/24/14 T

Klinkner

Klinkner

Klinkner

Klinkner

Xlinkner

Klinkner

.70

.60

.80

.70

80

<30

.90

Meeting with 8. Hutchings regarding DEC
Regulations and Mandatory Contract provisions;
conduct research regarding same

Draft city attormey report
Review agenda packet for 10/13 Council meeting

Review supplemental packet for Council meeting;
meet with W. Wrede regarding pending issues;
attend Council meetings

Review agenda packet for 10/20 Council meeting;
regearch and draft memorandum to Council
regarding use of hearing officer for land use
appeals

Telephone conferences with W. Wrede, C.
Thompson regarding regquest for City bed tax
authorization

Research and draft memorandum to Council

regarding use of hearing officer in land use
appeals

151



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
15 STHSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 (907) 276-1550
0z) 6535800 FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal LD No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer

November 12, 2014
City Council - General 2013-2014
10/27/14 T Klinkner 1.40 Review agenda packet for 10/27 Council meeting

10/28/14 H Wells .20 Telephone conference with J. Johmnson regarding
administrative matters

10/31/14 M Michaletsz 1.40 Conference with H. Wells and research regarding
model photography releases

FEES $11,550.00
Disbursements
10/14/14 Airport Parking Expense - re: T. Klinkner (NO NO CHARGE
CHARGE)
10/13/14 Lunch Meeting with Client - re: T. Klinkner 90.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $90.00

Total This Matter $11,640.00
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1620
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(07 553800 FAX (507) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer ' November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185770
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014 0.00
city Clerk - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkkkk%x PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *¥ikxidiii

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15?;322} MW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (507) 276-1550

{202) ¢55-5500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185770

491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014
Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

16/01/14 T Klinkner .20 Research and draft message to J. Johnson
' regarding petition for assessment district
formation
10/09/14 T Klinkner .20 Research and draft message to J. Johnson

regarding telephonic participation in manager
recruitment committee meetings

10/16/14 T Klinkner .30 Draft ordinance regarding issuance of dog
licenses
10/28/14 T Klinkner ;40 Draft revisions to title of Ordinance 14-49;

draft message to J. Johnson regarding same
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 155’2}1 rfg?oiin W ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fpom) 555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185771
491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Serxrvices Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0205 Enstar Service to Homer 0.00
Enstar Service to Homer

CURRENT CHARGES 30.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF QUTSTANDING INVOICES

*Ekkkkkdkd DULEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #**kdidixx

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO o ey E A VENGE

Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15‘1“?1) s]?;zé?ro N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6393800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 6506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185771
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, 3K 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

Matter: 0205

Enstar Service to Homer

10/23/14 T Kliﬁkner .90 Review payment terms in Enstar contract and

Enstar tariff; telephone conference with W.
Wrede regarding same

10/26/14 T Klinkner 2.20 Research and draft memorandum to W. Wrede on
effect of Castner case on condominium
assessments
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15?&{5&?;‘3“‘“ ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@r) 5580 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homerx Novembexr 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185772
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 9235603

For Professional Sexrvices Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 (City Manager - General 2013-2014 9.15
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $9.15

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE POR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

kkkkkxkdx% DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#k¥¥ &k

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, P’;LASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
154 15THSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6595800

RAX (907) 258-1726
Federal ID. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185772
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 21, 2014
Matter: 0215

City Manager - General 2013-2014

10/07/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research, analysis and draft message to W.
Wrede regarding Borough permission for City bed
tax

10/08/14 T Xlinkner .70 Analysis and revise message to W. Wrede

regarding Borough authorization of bed tax;
draft resolution regarding same

10/09/14 T Xlinkner .10 Review message from W. Wrede regarding election
results, bed tax issue

10/13/14 H Wells .80 Email correspondence with W. Wrede regarding
: social media policy; conduct research regarding
same
Disbursements
10/31/14 Computer Research 9.15
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $9.15
Total This Matter $9.15
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 112;31";22?1\’\# ’ ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
oy 50 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185774
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 399603

For Profegsional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 0.00
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*hkkkkkkxk DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **%%xkikikk

1127 \WWEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1158 15'1‘?{;51"?;51?; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (507) 276-1550
(20 6583800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185774

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014
Matter: 0563
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

10/03/14 T Klinkner .10 Review mesgage from W. Wrede regarding use of
hearing officer for zoning appeals
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

: 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
HSSSTHSTREET, ¥, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (507} 276-1550
{€02) 6555800 FAX (507) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homerxr November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185775
491 East Piloneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 0.00
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

**%*%%%%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DPAYMENT ***&akx#x

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added 10 amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
s 157?5;?’;?;} NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
{hoiy 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 188775

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 935603

For Professiocnal Services Rendered Through Octobexr 31, 2014
Matter: 0566
Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

10/23/14 H Wells 2.30 Review supplemental record on appeal; prepare
for remand
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
34 THSTREET, N.. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
ey 6353300 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Vi

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185776
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0700 Police Department - General 0.00
Police Department - General

CURRENT CHARGES : $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*%*%4**%% DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *#*%kx*%*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

163



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15?;2 31;};1:12; N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUSTE 1020
WASHING TON, 1.C. 20005 {907} 276-1550

{202) 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.1, No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Inveice # 185776

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 939603

For Professional Services Rendered Through COctober 31, 2014
Mattexr: 0700

Police Department - General

10/02/14 A Sperbeck .60 Review proposed MOU in preparation for
- telephonic meeting with chief of police
10/03/14 T Klinkner +20 Review materials regarding impeachment

procedure for perxrsonnel records; exchange of
messages with A. Sperbeck regarding same

10/03/14 A Sperbeck 2,70 Review Giglio MOU material on behalf of City
police department; legal research on issue

10/06/14 A Sperbeck .80 Correspondence with City police regarding
Giglio materisl

10/07/14 A Sperbeck 1.70 Teleconference with W. Wrede and M. Robl
regarding Giglic MOU with Department of Law;
make revisions to agreement per legal

recommendations

10/08/14 A Sperbeck 70 Telephone conference with City officials
regarding MOU

10/28/14 A Sperbeck .30 BEmail to client regarding Giglio material
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 12&1 ;;gzr W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 {907} 276-1550
(o) 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185777
491 Bast Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 389603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014 0.00
Port™ & Harbor - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF CUTSTANDING INVOICES

*hkkkkkkkh PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **kkxkkiki

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 4.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 13'1'?{;13;5}?; NW, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTORN, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(hor) 655.5500 - FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer November 12, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185777

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2014
Matter: 1331
Port & Harbor - CGeneral 2013-2014

10/16/14 T Klinkner .10 Review messages regarding disposal of old
- floats from small boat harbor
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1551{;;';1’11{0?;:1”, N . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
ey 6555820 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

P

Client: 506742
City of Homexr May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184541

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0018 City Council - General 2013-2014 11,000.00
City Council - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $11,000.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIET OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*k%*x%%%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *x%#k%i*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a,88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAY OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115 IST;ﬁ!:Eg}NW ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(e0z) 6535600 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184541

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 36, 2014

Matter: 0018

City Council - General 2013-2014

04/07/14 T Klinkner .50 Draft March 2014 city attorney report

04/10/14 T Klinkner 290 Review agenda packet for 4/14 Council meeting;
draft audit letter

04/14/14 T Xlinkner 4.60 Review supplemental agenda materials; attend
Council meetings

04/21/14 T Xlinkner .10 Sign adopted ordinances
04/25/14 T Klinkner .10 Review agenda for 4/28 Council mesating
04/28/14 T Klinkner .60 Review agenda packet for 4/28 Council meeting
FEES $11,000.00
03/17/14 RAirfare - re: T. Klinkner - Travel from NO CHARGE
Anchorage to Homer and return (NO CHARGE}
Total This Matter $11,000.00
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 1;’{?;&;? NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 995C1
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(B07) 653-5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneexr Avenue

Homer, AK 98603

For Profesgsional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0101 City Clerk - General 2013-2014
City Clerk - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

May 13, 2014
Invoice # 184542

$1.40

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kEkxxkkk* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **kkkikikx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 STHSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTGN, D.C. 20005 {907) 276-1550

{2023 6395800

FAX {907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184542
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

Matter: 0101

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

04/03/14 T KXlinkner .50 Regearch and draft messages to J. Johnson
regarding content of Board of Adjustment appeal

record and public participation at Board of
Adjustment meeting

-

04/11/14 T Klinkner .10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
agenda for 4/14 special meeting

04/15/14 H Wells 1.40 Email correspondence with J. Johnson regarding
alleged conflict and bias by council members
for Burgess; conduct research regarding same;
contact J. Johnson regarding same; email
corregpondence with J. Engebretsen regarding
CVP 14-05; meeting with T. Klinkner regarding
positioning of ethical screen regarding same

04/16/14 T Klinkner .20 Research and draft message to J. Johnson
regarding ordinance for elected official
compensation

04/17/14 T Klinkner 2.50 Regearch and draft ordinances regarding Mayor

and Council compensation, tower regulation

04/22/14 T Klinkner .10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
executive session memorandum
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 1STH STREET, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASH%?SS?DQ 20036 (907) 276-1550
bem) 6595500 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806
Client: 506742 Page: 2

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

City Clerk - General 2013-2014

04/29/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research and draft message to J. Johnson, et
al. regarding sponsorship of ordinance by City
Clerk '

04/29/14 T Xlinkner .20 Research and draft message to J. Johnson

regarding appearance of City Planner in Board
of Adjustment appeal

Disbursements
Postage 1.40
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 81.40

Total This Matter $1.40
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, NOW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 {907) 276-1550
(o) 6535808 4 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0202 Public Records Requests
Public Records Requests

CURRENT CHARGES

May 13, 2014
Invoice # 184543

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

#¥#kk+k%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT %k %k%%%%%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITINER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 157';?}?;2; N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
{pozy 555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184543
491 Bast Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

Matter: 0202

Public Records Requests

04/17/14 H Wells +90 Email correspondence and telephone conference
with W, Wrede regarding public records request;
meeting with T. Klinkner regarding same

04/28/14 T Klinkner .30 Review notice of appeal regarding public
records request; exchange of messages with W.
Wrede regarding settlement of same

04/29/14 T Klinkner .20 Exchange of messages with W. Wrede, et al.

regarding resolution and timeliness of F.
Griswold records request
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1S4 THLSTRGET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

£202) 659-5850

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0215 City Manager - General 2013-2014
City Manager - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

May 13, 2014
Invoice # 184544

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF CUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkxxxxk% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***%#s&kdk%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

174



TN

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 157';3’;;% NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 2761550
oz 6573800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Client: 506742
City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184544

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, BK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014
Matter: 0215
City Manager - General 2013-2014

04/30/14 T Klinkner .90 Search for cell phone service RFP
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE

156 STHSTREDT, N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 659-5800

FAX {907) 258-17256
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 992603

For Professicnal Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0300 Personnel-General

Personnel-General

CURRENT CHARGES

May 13, 2014
Invoice # 184545

$0.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

#xx#*kx** PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***x#kx&+

. 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANGCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ISTH STREET, V. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 » (907) 276-1550
(ho7) 39580 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184545

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homexr, AK 935603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 3¢, 2014

Matter: 0300

Personnel -General

04/30/14 A Limeres .30 Analysis and telephone conference with A.
Peterson regarding HIPAA disclosure issues and

use of surplus funds to offset health plan cost
increases
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 135'1&—1 sﬁiziww ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

£202) 659-5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer ’ May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184546

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 98603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0563 Planning/Development - General 2013-2014 36.54
Planning/Developmer;t - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES $36.54

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*¥kxxkxksd PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *¥*khdikik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 bf:‘;lﬁ:}g; N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (807) 276-1550
oo 6555800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No, 92-0046806

Client: 5086742
City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184546

491 ERast Pioneer Avenue
Homey, AX 99603

Por Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

Matter: 0563

Planning/Development - General 2013-2014

04/10/14 T Klinkner _ .10 Review ordinance request from G. Van Dyke

04/10/14 H Wells .30 Email correspondence with D. Harness regarding
heliport ordinance

04/16/14 T Xlinkner 1.40 Research and draft message to J. Engebretsen
regarding conditional use for deck extension
into setback '

04/18/14 T Klinkner .80 Draft revisions to ordinance amending
regulation of heliports

04/21/14 T Klinkner .90 Resgearch and draft code amendment to permit
farmers' markets as conditional uses in
commercial zones

04/21/14 T Klinkner .90 Research and draft code amendments regulating
the location of heliports and helipads

04/23/14 T Klinkner 1.10 Research and draft ordinance rezoning to East
End Mixed Use; draft message to J. Johnson

regarding same

04/28/14 T Klinkner .40 Review and respond to D. Harness comments on
heliport ordinance
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
156 ST STREET, .. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 {907) 276-1550

{207} 6555800

FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page: 2
City of Homer
May 13, 2014
Planning/Development - General 2013-2014
04/29/14 T Klinkner .50 Exchange of messages with D. Harness regarding
heliport ordinance; exchange of messages with

J. Johnson regarding tower ordinance

04/30/14 T XKlinkner 2.40 Revige heliport orxdinance; draft message to D.
Harness regarxding same

Disbursements .
04/30/14 Computer Research 36.54
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $36.54
Total This Matter $36.54
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TN

LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15TH STREET, NV, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUTTE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
fpon) €595800 ' FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer : May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184547

491 EBast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 895603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 0566 Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13 202.39

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

CURRENT CHARGES $202.39

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*x%k%k%%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT ***#%#k%+*

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501

Please note, there will be a.88% per month Jate charge added 1o amounts 60 days past due,
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
e ISTHSTRET . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
SUITE 1020
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907} 276-1550

07} 6595600
¢

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal LD. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184547
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 95603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014

Matter: 0566

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/04/14 H Wells 3.10 Review briefing and prepare for hearing

04/08/14 H Wells 5.80 Review Griswold's reply brief; prepare hearing
transcript; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding conflict of interest matters
for presentation to the Board; draft response
to additional procedural issues

04/09/14 M McNabb 5.80 Conferences with H. Wells; research and analyze
City code regarding standing to appeal to Board
of Adjustment; review email frxrom T. Klinkner
regarding standing to appeal; review emails
from City to Griswold regarding procedural
issues; research and analyze City code
regarding information regquired on applications
for CUP's; review record on appeal; research
and analyze unauthorized practice of law and
whether party who does not file brief can
participate in oral argument; draft responses
to procedural guestions posed by Griswold;
shepardize cases regarding dual representation;
emall H. Wells
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

: 1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
HSGSTHSTREET, .. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 2003 (907) 276-1550

{202) 659-5800

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client:

City of Homer

Griswold

04/08/14

04/10/14

04/11/14

04/14/14

04/14/14

04/16/14

04/17/14

04/22/14

May 13, 2014

Appeal of CUP 13-13

H Wells 8.20 Attend and prepare for hearing; revise and
expand hearing procedural agenda; meetings with
J. Johnson and D, Gross regarding same

D Gross .50 Conference regarding procedural issues related-
to hearing

H Wells 1.40 Email correspondence with J. Johnson and
telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
Griswold's supplemental brief's; review brief

M McNabb .60 Conference with H. Wells regarding potential
conflict of interest, phone S. Van Goor and
leave a voicemail message, discuss drafting
Board of Adjustment decision

H Wells 4.90 Telephone conference with §. Van Goor regarding
conflict of interest challenges; meeting with
D. Gross regarding conflicts of interest and
research regarding City's position; email
correspondence with F. Griswold regarding spot
zoning; conduct research regarding same

H Wells .80 Email correspondence with F. Griswold regarding
supplemental authority; conduct research
regarding process of addressing same

H Wells 2.30 Telephone conference with Mayor regarding
procedural matters surrounding F. Griswold’'s
supplemental filings; conduct research
regarding same; telephone conference with J.
Johnson regarding procedural matters; conduct
research regarding same

M McNabb .20 Review notes regarding drafting Board of
Adjustment's decision
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
s STHSTREET, . ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20036 {907) 276-1550
ron 6353800 FAX (907) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046306
Client: 506742 v Page: 3

City of Homer
May 13, 2014

Griswold Appeal of CUP 13-13

04/23/14 H Wells 3.10 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
supplemental filings; initiate scribing of
Board's final decision

04/25/14 H Wells 2.70 Telephone conference with J. Johnson regarding
Board procedural matters; conduct research
regarding same

Disbursements -
04/30/14 Computer Research 202.39
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $202.39

Total This Matter - $202.39
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LAW OFFICES

BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 liTLI;;gxor;ET W, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
@02) 6555850 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30,

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1331 Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

CURRENT CHARGES

May 13, 2014
Invoice # 184548

2014

13.50

$13.50

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*x¥k%% %k x* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT **k#kxikik

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
 Please note, there will be a 88% per month late charge added 1o amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1S STHSTREET, ¥, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550

{202) 6595800

FAX (507) 258-1726
Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer May 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184548
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2014
Matter: 1331
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014

04/04/14 T Klinkner .10 Exchange of messages with A. Browning regarding
lease assignment

04/18/14 H Wells .90 Telephcone conference with B. Hawkins regarding
hearing and tariff updates; conduct reseaxch
regarding same

04/23/14 T Klinkner .20 Analysis of fish pump proposal issue

04/25/14 H Wells 1.10 Telephone conference with B. Hawkins regarding
revisions to moorage agreements; conduct
regsearch regarding same

04/30/14 T Klinkner .40 Telephone conference with W. Wrede regarding
seller financing of assignment of City lease;
research and draft message to W. Wrede
regarding same
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15?;1 grﬁi; NW. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 200%6 {907) 276-1550
(p02) £59-5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742 Page:
City of Homer

May 13,
Port & Harbor - General 2013-2014
Disbursements

03/01/14 Research/Ingens Usage Costs - re: The Tatitlek
Corporation / Intel Data LLC

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

Total This Matter
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2014

13.50

$13.50

$13.50
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City of Homer

Office of the City Manager

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, Alaska 99603

www.cityofhomer-ak.gov

December 10, 2014

Mr. Frank Griswold
519 Klondike
SUBJECT: Records Request dated 11/11/14

Dear Mr. Griswold:

citymanager@cityothomer-ak.gov
(p) 907-235-8121 x2222
(f) 907-235-3148

Invoices from attorney Joe Levesque were inadvertently omitted from the City’s response to your
Records Request dated November 11, 2014. Those invoices are attached. Limited redactions, mostly
names, were entered by attorney Levesque and his staff under Attorney- Client privilege ( HCC

2.84.040).

These redactions could be viewed as a partial adverse determination. You are therefore notified of
your right to appeal this decision to the Homer City Council (R.5.01 and HCC 2.84.070).

-

Sincerely,

City Manager
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Levesque Law Group, LILC

3380 "C" Street, Suite 202
Anchorage, AK 99503

Phone: (907) 261-8935

Invoice submitted to:

City of Homer

491 E. Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

Walt Wrede, City Manager

October 07, 2014

in Reference FOR PROFESSIONAL ILEGAL SERVICES
To: Frank Griswold BOA Appeal
Our File No. 190-13

Invoice# 11985

Professional Services

9/16/12014 JNL Telephone call re Board of
Adjustment hearing. Telephone call i
re same. Receive and

begin reviewing record on appeal from Clerk

SJG Review flight options to Homer with attorney
to attend BOA hearing. Review email
with 2
attachments including record on appeai
documents. Print documents for attorney
review and reference at hearing. Compile
notebook for use.

SJG Prepare engagement letter for City of Homer:

SJG Prepare email
transmitting Engagement letter for legal services.

191

2.40 420.00

0.70 80.50

0.50 NO CHARGE
0.20 NO CHARGE
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL

SERVICES

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal

Our File No. 190-13

Page 2
October 07, 2014

9/16/2014 SJG

9/17/2014  JNL

SJG

SJG

9/18/2014 SJG

JNL

9/19/2014 SJG

Levesque Law Group, LI.C
Hours Amount
Prepare email 0.10 11.50

advising of need for attorney
Levesque to overnight after BOA hearing.

Email from City clerk re sending out notice of
hearing. Email to clerk re same. Receive and
review notice of hearing. Telephone call

re appeal hearing procedures.
Receive and review 6 emails T
with copies of pleadings, scripts, efc. Receive
and review email ‘re

Review and respond to email

providing attorney °
travel itinerary and re-transmitting engagement
letter for review and signature.

Review email
transmitting signed engagement letter. Save
letter to network and file.

Review
questions posed by Frank Griswold.

Receive and review email re
questions from Griswold. Exchange emails

re same. Continue review of email
chain 7 77T Receive and review .
o " response to . Griswold. Continue
review of record.

Review email from Frank Griswold responding

to email from Clerk . re specific
questions. Save email to network and file for

193

210 367.50

0.20 NO CHARGE

0.20 NO CHARGE

0.10 11.50
3.70 647.50
0.10 11.50
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL

SERVICES

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal

Our File No. 190-13

Page 3
October 07, 2014

9/19/2014 SJG

SJG

JNL

9/24/2014  JNL

9/26/2014 SJG

JNL

9/29/2014 SJG

JNL

Levesque Law Group, LILC
Hours Amount
future reference.
Review and print numerous documents 0.40 46.00

provided by separate emails containing case
and appeal documents, routing to proper
subfiles and saving to electronic network for
future reference and retrieval.

Compile Copy of Decision and save to network,
print for file.

Receive and review Griswold's response to
email. Continue reviewing record on
appeal briefs.

Review record on appeal. Identify issues
presented by Appellant.

Receive and review email
Print for attorney review and response

Continue reviewing record on appeal and
outstanding procedural issue.

Research
_ ) Exchange
multiple emails _ )
transmitting ~ ~ " cases located.
Review ..., .. _ _ .. .. .and compare
. Email re approved.

Continue review of record on appeal and
identifying procedural issues re same. Email to

195

0.20

2.20

1.00

0.20

1.00

0.40

6.60

23.00

385.00

175.00

23.00

175.00

46.00

1,1565.00
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL

SERVICES

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal

Our File No. 190-13

Page 4
October 07, 2014

9/29/2014  JUNL

9/30/2014 SJG

SJG

JNL

JNL

SEL

SEL

re flight to Homer. Prepare for
he_aring, i.e._ rev@ew issue_§ ‘
Attend Board of Adjustment hearing re same.
Travel to Homer from Anchorage. (No charge)
Discuss with attorney of last
evening's hearing. Review additional cases
identified re and save to network for
future reference.
Compile all cases compiled re Set
up electronic folders to manage data and
documents. Create Master Index of ali files.

Return to Anchorage from Homer. (No Charge)

Email re
decision of Board. Read and review case and
Homer Code re . Email ordinances to

Mayor and Clerk. Exchange emails
re recordings.

Conduct research re issues of

Research code provisions for Alaska
municipalities ) o

Additional Charges :

9/29/2014 Airfare on Ravn Air from Anchorage to Homer (9/29/2014)
#8082103932840 (Joe Levesque)

197

Levesque Law Group, LILO

Hours Amount

1.50 NO CHARGE
0.30 NO CHARGE

0.40 NO CHARGE

1.50 NO CHARGE

1.90 332.50
0.40 66.00
1.10 181.50

120.00
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL

SERVICES Levesque Law Group, LIC
Frank Griswold BOA Appeal
Our File No. 190-13
Page 5
October 07, 2014
Amount
9/29/2014 Airfare on Ravn Air from Homer to Anchorage, (9/30/2014) 120.00
#8082103933621 (Joe Levesque)
Hotel Accommodations in Homer (Best Western) to attend BOA 87.06
Hearing 9/29/2014. (Joe Levesque)
9/30/2014 Airport Parking for attendance at BOA Hearing in Homer (9/29/14). 15.00
{Joe Levesque)
Lexis Research Subscription Charges 8.05
Total amount of this bill $4,508.11
Balance due $4,508.11
TimeKeeper Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
Joseph N. Levesque 20.90 175.00 ~ $3,657.50
Joseph N. Levesque 3.00 0.00 $0.00
Shane Levesque 150 165.00 $247.50
Shelley J. Garey 220 115.00 $253.00
Shelley J. Garey 1.80 0.00 $0.00
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Levesque Law Group, LIC

3380 "C" Street, Suite 202
Anchorage, AK 99503

Phone: (907) 261-8935

Invoice submitted to:
City of Homer
491 E. Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603
Walit Wrede, City Manager

November 07, 2014

In Reference FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL SERVICES
To: Frank Griswold BOA Appeal (CUP-14-05)
Our File No. 190-13

Invoice# 12047
Professional Services

Hours _ Amount

10/2/2014 JNL Begin outlining and drafting Decision. 1.60 280.00

10/3/2014  JNL Receive and review recording of Board of 1.60 262.50
Adjustment hearing.

10/6/2014  JNL Continue listening to hearing tape and outline 2.50 437.50
Decision re same.

10/7/2014 JNL Continue drafting decision of BOA. 1.00 175.00

10/8/2014 JNL Continue working on decision. 1.00 175.00

10/9/2014 JNL Continue reviewing record and listening to tape 1.60 262.50

recording of hearing.
10/10/2014  JNL Continue drafting decision. 1.50 262.50

10/13/2014 JNL Review City Code re 1.00 175.00

201



202



FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL Levesque Law Group, LILC

SERVICES

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal
(CUP-14-05)

Our File No. 190-13

Page 2
November 07, 2014

10/14/2014 JNL Continue drafting decision.

10/15/2014 JNL Review record on appeal portions re : and
draft decision.

10/16/2014  JNL Continue reviewing material and drafting decision.

10/17/2014  UNL Continue drafting decision

10/21/2014  JUNL Continue reviewing material and drafting decision.

10/22/2014 JNL Continue reviewing material and drafting decision.

10/23/2014 SJG Review of initial rough draft of BOA Decision by
attorney saving to network and begin

work to format and revise as necessary.

SJG Work on review and revision of initial draft
Decision of BOA.

JNL Exchange emails re
decision on appeal. Continue finalizing draft
decision.

10/24/2014 SJG Resume work to review and revise initial draft of
Decision on Appeal. Review case authorities cited
to confirm accurate quotations and citations.

SJG Prepare Order and Certification to include on draft
Decision and make additional revisions.

SJG Prepare email to attorney transmitting

initial draft Decision for review and further
revisions/ supplementation.

203

Hours Amount
1.00 175.00
1.50 262.50
1.30 227.50
2.80 490.00
1.50 262.50
1.30 227.50
0.50 57.50
0.80 92.00
1.70 297.50
1.50 172.50
0.50 57.50
0.30 34.50
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL
SERVICES Levesque Law Group, 1.I.C

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal
(CUP-14-05)
Our File No. 190-13

Page 3

November 07, 2014
Hours = Amount

10/24/2014 SJG Continue work to review and revise further Draft 0.80 92.00
Decision upon review by attorney . Add
significant new sections and provisions. Add
Notice of appeal rights and review with attorney
draft.

SJG Work further to make revisions to draft Decision 0.50 57.50
on Appeal upon further review and revision of
attorney

SJG Prepare email to attorney ~ transmitting 0.20 23.00
final draft of Decision to be forwarded to

City.
JNL Edit and revise draft decision. Email draft 1.70 297.50

Additional Charges :

10/31/2014 Copy charges for OCTOBER 23.40
Lexis 30.91
Total amount of this bill $4,910.81
Previous balance $4,508.11
10/20/2014 Thank you for your payment! Check No. ($4,508.11)

Total payments and adjustments (%4,508.11)
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL | )
SERVICES Levesque Law Group, LILC

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal

(CUP-14-05)

Our File No. 190-13

Page 4

November 07, 2014

Amount
Balance due '$4,910.81
TimeKeeper Summary

Name Hours Rate Amount
Joseph N. Levesque ; 2440 175.00 $4,270.00
Shelley J. Garey 510 115.00 $586.50
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Invoice submitted to:

City of Homer

Levesque Law Group, LILC

3380 "C" Street, Suite 202
Anchorage, AK 99503

Phone: (907) 261-8935

491 E. Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

Walt Wrede, City Manager

December 08, 2014

In Reference FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL SERVICES
To: Frank Griswold BOA Appeal (CUP-14-05)
Our File No. 180-13

Invoice # 12126

Professional Services

11/3/2014  JNL

11/5/2014  SJG

11/11/2014  JNL

11/13/2014  JNL

SJG

11/25/2014  JNL

Hours Amount

Receive and review e-mail 0.40 70.00

re: Decision. E-mail B (-5
same.
Review, revise and finalize draft Decision on 0.50 57.50
appeal. Provide to attorney for final
review and revision.
Review draft decision. 0.30 52.50
Final review of Decision. 0.20 35.00
Work on finalizing BOA Decision, reviewing and 0.40 46.00
finalizing formatting. Prepare pdf copy to transmit
to City.
Receive and review email with_ 1.70 297.50

Griswold's motion for reconsideration. Email
re motion. Email re
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FOR PROFESSIONAL LEGAL
SERVICES Levesque Law Group, LLC

Frank Griswold BOA Appeal
(CUP-14-05)
Our File No. 190-13

Page 2

December 08, 2014
Hours Amount

same. Review decision denying motion for
reconsideration.

11/25/2014 SJG Review email 0.30 34.50
providing Griswold's Motion for Reconsideration.
Save attachment to network and print for file and
attorney review. Review and save attorney
response re same.

Additional Charges :

11/28/2014 Copy charges for NOVEMBER. 16.80
Total amount of this bill $609.80
Previous balance $4,910.81

12/1/2014 Thank you for your payment! Check No. ($4,910.81)
Total payments and adjustments ($4,910.81)

Balance due $609.80

TimeKeeper Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount

Joseph N. Levesque 260 175.00 $455.00
Shelley J. Garey 120 115.00 $138.00
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Office of the City Manager

491 East Pioneer Avenue

City of Homer Homer, Alaska 99603

www.cityofhomer-ak.gov citymanager@cityofhomer-ak.gov
(p) 907-235-8121 x2222

(f) 907-235-3148

December 11, 2014

Mr. Frank Griswold

519 Klondike

SUBJECT: Records Request dated 11/11/14 and e-mail message dated 12/5/2014.

Dear Mr. Griswold:

This responds to your email message of December 5, 2014. My previous response included a

description of the records requested, a description of the records that will not be provided, and the
reasons for the adverse determination, as required by Public Records Request Regulation 5.01. The
redacted August 12, 2014 time entry was recorded under matter no. 576 in error.and concerned an

unrelated litigation matter.

It is not necessary to provide specific time entries to establish that there is an attorney-client
relationship between Birch Horton Bittner and Cherot and the City of Homer. That is a matter of
common knowledge. The terms of that relationship are in a written contract, which you may inspect
upon request. Nonetheless, | am enclosing summaries of the amount billed for each litigation matter

from May through November 2014.

- This is my final determination in response to your December 5, 2014 request. You may appeal this
determination to the City Council under Homer City Code Section 2.84.070.

4

City Manager

Sincerely,

alt Wrede
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Walt Wrede

L T
From: Walt Wrede
Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 5:00 PM
To: Walt Wrede
Subject: FW: November 11, 2014 Public Records Request
Attachments: 00420323.PDF

Sent: Friday, December 05, 2014 10:13 AM

To: Walt Wrede

Cc: Jo Johnson

Subject: Re: November 11, 2014 Public Records Request

Please provide a description of all time entries for litigation matters that were omitted (as required by
Regulation 5.01). Please explain why the omitted entries concerning litigation matters and the two redactions
qualify for exemption from disclosure due to attorney-client privilege. Please explain what special
circumstance(s) exist with respect to the redacted August 12, 2014 entry for Holly Wells that differentiates it
from the unredacted entries on Invoice 185409 and why even the amount of time she billed the city is deemed
confidential. Excerpt from Moudy v. Superior Court (Alaska 1998):

"The view of courts from around the country is that the attorney-client privilege does not authorize an attorney
to refuse to disclose the fact that communications have taken place between a client and an attorney. The case
law on this point is summarized in the following passage from Stephen A. Saltzburg, Michael M. Martin, and
Daniel J. Capra, Federal Rules of Evidence Manual (7th ed. 1998), Vol. 2, pp. 711-12: [T]he [attorney-client]
privilege does not protect the preliminary aspects of the attorney-client relationship itself. These matters, which
have been referred to as the &quot;incidents of representation,&quot; include the client's name, the amount and
payment of a fee, and the fact of consultation. The incidents of representation are not generally considered
privileged because they are independent of the confidential communications necessary for the representation.
The identity of the client, the fee, and the fact and extent of representation are generally incidental to the
formation and maintenance of the relationship, and have nothing to do with the free flow of information once
that relationship has been established. . . . As Judge Winter stated in the leading case of In re Shargel, 742 F.2d
61 (2d Cir. 1984): Absent special circumstances, disclosure of the identity of the client and fee information
stand on a footing different from communi-cations intended by the client to explain a problem to [the] lawyer in
order to obtain legal advice.... A general rule requiring disclosure of the fact of consultation does not place
attorneys in the professional dilemma of cautioning [the client] against disclosure and [thereby] rendering
perhaps ill-informed advice or [on the other hand] learning all the details and [thus] perhaps increasing the
perils to the client of disclosure."

On Dec 5, 2014, at 8:50 AM, Walt Wrede wrote:

Mr. Griswold:

Oh yeah. That is right. I believe two invoices were received and processed. We'll get them ready. The Clerk's
will let you know when they are available.

1
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On another matter, your 12/2 Records Request is being processed but it may take a little longer than usual. We
are presently short staffed in the IT Department and there are other pressing priorities/emergencies that need
attention. You should have this material no later than the middle of next week.

Walt

From: Frank Griswold [mailto:fsgriz @alaska.net]
Sent: Thursday, December 04, 2014 4:14 PM

To: Walt Wrede

Cc: Jo Johnson

Subject: November 11, 2014 Public Records Request

Mr. Wrede:
On November 11, 2014 i requested all invoices for legal services provided to the city between May 16, 2014
and November 11, 2014. Attorney Joseph Levesque provided legal services to the city during this period

regarding the appeal of CUP 14-05 but no invoices from him or his law firm were included in the records you
provided for my inspection. Was this an oversight?

Frank Griswold
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
115 15TH STREET, N, ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550
Gony es3580 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager
431 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through May 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1326 Fred R. Kelly Collection

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

June 12, 2014
Invoice # 184765

82.00

$82.00

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kk¥k*¥%% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*k**%xk%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 11T£;$E§T'N-W- ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 (907) 276-1550
(207) 6525800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client:. 506742
.City of Homer July 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 184898

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AKX 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Jun 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0560 v Matt Shadle 2,558.11
Matter: 1328 The Auction Block Company V. 237.75
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $2,795.86

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

¥kkkkkki* PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%*k&%xkx

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ;%CX%%EANWIHK’;VEN”SUOF

Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
56 155'13; igfé‘o‘:'r' N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 26005 (907) 276-1550
faon 659500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer August 8, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185108

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0704 v Paul and Crystal Riedel 756.00
Matter: 1328 The Auction Block Company v. 90.2¢9
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $846.29

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES
**x*k*%** PLEASE RETURN THIS PACE WITH YOUR DAYMENT **#kk%%x

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
ussxirmoﬁzﬁr, N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(boz) 653.5800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185402
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homer, AK 938603

For Professional Sexrvices Rendered Through Aug 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0704 v Paul and Crystal Riedel 776.72
Matter: 1328 The Auction Block Company v. 362,27
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $1,138.99

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

*kkkkdkkks PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT #*#*kiiiii

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 153'!‘;;331 N ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(a0z) 55500 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer . September 17, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185413

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through August 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:
Matter: 1332 Auction Block Appeal 1,311.50
Auction Block Appeal

CURRENT CHARGES $1,311.50

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST'OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

**%%*x**%* DLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%kk¥kk%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 {5TH STREET, N3 ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(a0z) 6535800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal 1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer October 13, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185568
491 East Pioneer Avenue

Homexr, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0704 v Paul and Crystal Riedel 2,167.20
Matter: 1332 Auction Block Appeal 4,080.79
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $6,247.99

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

**%***%** PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR DAYMENT #*k*+ik+

WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO AR CHOTACE A Rt h BT

Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.

227



228



LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 ’Zﬁmﬁ"" Nw. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C, 20005 {907) 276-1550
(207) 6593800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I1.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742

City of Homer November 12, 2014

Attn: Walt Wrede, City Manager Invoice # 185768
491 Bast Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0560 v Matt Shadle 450.00
Matter: 1332 BAuction Block Appeal 90.93
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $540.93

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES

**kkkkkkk% PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%%%#&k¥k%

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be 2 .88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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LAW OFFICES
BIRCH HORTON BITTNER & CHEROT

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
1156 15;’1:55111{;3251'.N.W. ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
WASHINGTON, D.C. 20005 (907) 276-1550
(02) 6595800 FAX (907) 258-1726

Federal I.D. No. 92-0046806

Client: 506742
City of Homer December 9, 2014
Attn: Walt Wrede, City Managexr Invoice # 185928

491 East Pioneer Avenue
Homer, AK 99603

For Professional Services Rendered Through Nov 30, 2014

CURRENT CHARGES:

Matter: 0560 v Matt Shadle 113.40
Matter: 1332 Auction Block Appeal 4,773.00
Matter: 1672 Lewandowski ASCHR Complaint 3,751.69

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $8,638.09

PLEASE SEE LAST PAGE FOR A LIST OF OUTSTANDING INVOICES
*****%**%% DPLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT *%#%¥k%#kx

1127 WEST SEVENTH AVENUE
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501
Please note, there will be a.88% per month late charge added to amounts 60 days past due.
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