City of Homer Surplus Equipment List EXHIBIT A
November 2013

ITEM # NAME DESCRIPTION SALE STATUS
CHO1 |Desk Black Metal w/Return No Bid Received
CH 02 Desk Black Metal w/Return No Bid Received
CHO03 |Desk Black Metal no Return Keri-Ann Baker $1.00
CHO04 |Desk Black Metal no Return No Bid Received
CHO08 [Filing Cabinet Two Drawer Letter Size Craig Oliver $1.25
CHO09 |[Filing Cabinet Three Drawer Extra Long/Extra Heavy Michael Kennedy $.89
CH10 |Table Desk Table - wood Keri-Ann Baker $1.00
CH11 |Cabinet Unit Long Tan Metal Drawers and Sliding Doors Craig Oliver $1.25
CH 13 Desk Brown Metal Desk Craig Oliver $1.25
CH15 [Desk Adjustable No Bid Received
CH17 |Table Wood - Light Color James Nelson $10.00
CH18 |Table Wood with Wheels James Nelson $5.00
CH19 |Desk Rubbermaid with Drawers James Nelson $20.00
CH22 |Table Round Table Craig Oliver $1.25
CH 25 [Keyboard Platform Black No Bid Received
CH 26 |Digital Camera Sony Digital Maciva Camera with Case No Bid Received
CH 27 |Overhead Projector Includes 1 lightbulb and Instructions No Bid Received
CH29 |TV Toshiba 27"(?) with Remote No Bid Received
CH30 |TV Panasonic 13" No Bid Received
CH31 |TV Symphonic 13" No Bid Received
CH32 |VCR Zenith with Remote No Bid Received
CH33 [Typewriter IBM Wheel Writer No Bid Received
CH 40 |Chair Black Metal with Arms Keri-Ann Baker $1.00
CH41 |Desk Black Metal with Return No Bid Received
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CH42 |Chair Padded Brown Chair No Bid Received
CH56 |Table Tan Metal Desk Table No Bid Received
CH 64 Printer/Copy Cartridges [Various HP and Xerox Printer/Copier Cartridges No Bid Received
CH 58 [Chairs 15 - Grey Padded Chairs - Sold as One Unit James Nelson $10.00
CH60 [Computer Desk Wood with wheels No Bid Received
CH61 |Table Wood No Bid Received
CH62 |Typewriter IBM Wheel Writer No Bid Received
CH63 |Couch Full Sized Couch with a Cover Craig Oliver $1.25
PWO01 [Sink Wall Mounted Sink No Bid Received
PW 02 |Sink Round Sink w/Faucet Craig Oliver $1.25
PW 03 |[Sink New Under Counter Sink Michael Kennedy $.89
PW 04 |[Toilet Used Mansfield Toilet No Bid Received
PW 05 |Oreck Vacuum XL Comvac 27" Vacuum Lary Kuhns $30.00
PW 07 |Air Conditioner Comfort Air Window Air Conditioner Michael Kennedy $.89
PD 01 Home Gym Precor Odyssey Home Gym CW 2006 James Nelson $50.00

95 Chevrolet Suburban 4WD, Engine top end rebuild 11/05 @

65,800 miles. Reconditioned Engine 03/06. Mileage to date

86,509. History of problems w/fuel injection system and start-
FD 01 Vehicle up in below freezing temps. Michael Riley $660.00
PHO1 Hot Water Heater Coleman On-Demand Hot Water Heater, Propane Michael Kennedy $15.89
PH02 |Cooler Igloomate 40 Cooler, 12 volt DC, No Adapter Michael Kennedy $2.89
PH 03 Boat Trailer Single Axle, Homemade, 8512PS No Bid Received
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PH 04 Boat Trailer Single Axle, Calkins, 9296 RW David Bolt $206.00
PH 05 Boat Trailer Single Axle, Homemade, No License Plate No Bid Received
PH 06 Boat Trailer Single Axle, Homemade, No License Plate No Bid Received
PH 07 Boat & Trailer 26' Fiberglass Boat, Sea Senor, & Double Axle Trailer Jim Hathaway $1,260.00

PH 08 Boat Trailer Double Axle, Homemade (Patrol Skiff Trailer) Craig Oliver $111.00
PH 09 Vehicle, E-506 1990 Chevy Blazer, XXR 654 Michael Kennedy $777.77
PH10 [Chain Saws 2 Sthil and 1 Husqavarna (to be sold together) Lary Kuhns $151.00
PH11 [Fuel Transfer System Simplex SPS-20, Day tank filling system, two pumps No Bid Received
PH 12 Dewalt Tool Boxes Dewalt Power Tool Boxes, Empty, 8 each Michael Kennedy 1.89
PH 13 Sign Posts 6' Long, Galvanized Steel, 60 each Christine Szocinski $53.03
PH 14 Seine Web 3.5" Salmon Seine Web, 4'X4'X5' Bundle Michael Kennedy $6.89
PH 15 Misc. Shore Ties 3-Phase Receptacles/Outlets, 120/480 volt, 3 each Michael Kennedy $6.89
PH 16 Electrical Cabinets Approximate Size 3'X3'X1', 3 each (2 stainless, 1 steel) Michael Kennedy $6.89
PH17 |Life Raft Viking, 4 person Lary Kuhns $125.00
PH18 |Concrete Vault Lids 7' dia. X 9"H, 7 each Michael Kennedy $2.89
PH19 |Dry Chem Extinguishers [Wheeled, 75# dry chem, need servicing, 2 each Michael Kennedy $11.89
PH20 |Crab Pot Square, 4' x 4' x 27" Michael Kennedy $.89
Pneumatic ice delivery system, blower and motor, rotary
valve, heat exchanger, diverter valves, 330' aluminum 5" pipe,
PH21 |[Ice Delivery system 20' aluminum 6" pipe, assorted fittings, etc. No Bid Received




